

Bid Opening Commenced: 03/20/14 PM 03:03:01 CC PURCHAS

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

Bid Opening Concluded:

No. of Packages Received: 4

**BID OPENING RECORD
GOODS AND SERVICES**

No. of Bids Received: 4

Date: **03/20/2014**

Bid Recorded By:

Karen Dexter

03/20/14 PM 03:18:19 CC PURCHAS
(CC Clerk)

Bid No.: **B603245-14**

Purchasing Representative: **ADRIANE GARCIA**

Bid Title: **VARIOUS CURRENT PRODUCTION MODEL VEHICLES**

Company Name	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Received on Time		Bid Addendums Acknowledged		Bid Signed	
			Yes	No	Yes	No	Yes	No
<i>Jord Country</i>	N/A	N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>
1. Current Production Model Midsize Sport Utility Vehicle All Wheel Drive Smartway Certified	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
2. Current Production Model 10 Passenger Van	\$ <i>27,258.00</i>	\$ <i>54,516.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
3. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels with Fully Enclosed Utility Body	\$ <i>45,197.00</i>	\$ <i>45,197.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
4. Current Production Model 1-Ton Cab & Chassis, Crew Cab, 4x4 with Flat Bed & Lift Gate	\$ <i>49,262.00</i>	\$ <i>49,262.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
5. Current Production Model 1-Ton Diesel Dually, (4x2) 2-Wheel Drive, Utility Bed Extended Cab Pickup with Towing Package and Lift Gate	\$ <i>45,999.00</i>	\$ <i>45,999.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
6. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Pickup, Regular Cab, Utility Bed with Ladder Rack and Towing Package	\$ <i>42,651.00</i>	\$ <i>42,651.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No.: _____

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

**BID OPENING RECORD
GOODS AND SERVICES**

Company Name	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Received on Time	Bid Addendums Acknowledged	Bid Signed
<i>Fairway Chevrolet</i>	N/A	N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/> Yes <input type="radio"/> No	Yes <input checked="" type="radio"/> No	Yes <input checked="" type="radio"/> No
1. Current Production Model Midsize Sport Utility Vehicle All Wheel Drive Smartway Certified	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A
2. Current Production Model 10 Passenger Van	\$ <i>19,768.00</i>	\$ <i>39,536.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A
3. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels with Fully Enclosed Utility Body	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A
4. Current Production Model 1-Ton Cab & Chassis, Crew Cab, 4x4 with Flat Bed & Lift Gate	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A
5. Current Production Model 1-Ton Diesel Dually, (4x2) 2-Wheel Drive, Utility Bed Extended Cab Pickup with Towing Package and Lift Gate	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A
6. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Pickup, Regular Cab, Utility Bed with Ladder Rack and Towing Package	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No.: _____

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

**BID OPENING RECORD
GOODS AND SERVICES**

Company Name	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Received on Time		Bid Addendums Acknowledged		Bid Signed	
			Yes	No	Yes	No	Yes	No
<i>Hairway Buick GMC</i>	N/A	N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>
1. Current Production Model Midsize Sport Utility Vehicle All Wheel Drive Smartway Certified	\$ <i>24,268.00</i>	\$ <i>169,876.00</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
2. Current Production Model 10 Passenger Van	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
3. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels with Fully Enclosed Utility Body	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
4. Current Production Model 1-Ton Cab & Chassis, Crew Cab, 4x4 with Flat Bed & Lift Gate	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
5. Current Production Model 1-Ton Diesel Dually, (4x2) 2-Wheel Drive, Utility Bed Extended Cab Pickup with Towing Package and Lift Gate	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
6. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Pickup, Regular Cab, Utility Bed with Ladder Rack and Towing Package	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No.: _____

CLARK COUNTY, NEVADA

**BID OPENING RECORD
GOODS AND SERVICES**

Company Name	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Received on Time		Bid Addendums Acknowledged		Bid Signed	
			Yes	No	Yes	No	Yes	No
<i>Haudin Ford</i>	N/A	N/A	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input checked="" type="radio"/>	<input type="radio"/>
1. Current Production Model Midsize Sport Utility Vehicle All Wheel Drive Smartway Certified	\$ <i>no bid</i>	\$ <i>no bid</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	
2. Current Production Model 10 Passenger Van	\$ <i>28,017.61</i>	\$ <i>56,035.22</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	
3. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels with Fully Enclosed Utility Body	\$ <i>45,436.40</i>	\$ <i>45,436.40</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	
4. Current Production Model 1-Ton Cab & Chassis, Crew Cab, 4x4 with Flat Bed & Lift Gate	\$ <i>49,289.95</i>	\$ <i>49,289.95</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	
5. Current Production Model 1-Ton Diesel Dually, (4x2) 2-Wheel Drive, Utility Bed Extended Cab Pickup with Towing Package and Lift Gate	\$ <i>46,571.75</i>	\$ <i>46,571.75</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	
6. Current Production Model 1-Ton 4x4 Diesel Pickup, Regular Cab, Utility Bed with Ladder Rack and Towing Package	\$ <i>46,031.68</i>	\$ <i>46,031.68</i>	N/A		N/A		N/A	