Department of Administrative Services

Purchasing and Contracts

500 S Grand Central Pky 4th FI « Box 551217 - Las Vegas NV 89155-1217
(702) 455-2897 « Fax (702) 386-4914

Sabra Smith Newby, Chief Administrative Officer
Adleen B. Stidhum, Purchasing Administrator

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO AWARD

AUGUST 14, 2014

It is the intent of the Clark County Administrative Services Department, Purchasing and Contracts
Division, to recommend award of Bid No.603346-14, Annual Requirements Contract for Keys, Locks and
Locksmith Services to Intermountain Lock and Security Supply Co. for Lots 1, 2, 3, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11,
12, 13, 14, 16 and 17 and to Clark Security Products, Anixter Inc. for Lots 4, 15 and 18 on September 16,

2014. Lot 19 has been cancelled.

The attached Bid Tabulation provides the detail for each bid submittal received by lot. The low bidder for
each lot was determined by the highest percentage discount off of manufacturer’s list price offered, which

resulted in the lowest total cost by vendor, as represented.

In accordance with the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document, all Bidders have five (5) business
days from receipt of this notification to submit a formal written protest to the Purchasing Analyst. The
Board of County Commissioners is not required to consider any protest that is not filed in accordance with
the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document.

If you have any questions concerning this notification, please contact Adriane Garcia, Sr. Purchasing
Analyst, at (702) 455-2733.

Sr. Purchasing Analyst

Attachment(s) Bid No. 603346-14 Bid Tabulation

Cc: Jerry Stueve, Real Property Management
Lisa Kremer, Real Property Management
Brian Connolly, Real Property Management
Darren Daniels, Real Property Management - Operations
Mark Larson, Real Property Management - Operations
Matt Garban, Real Property Management - Operations
Wayne Wedlow, Real Property Management - Operations
Pat Lachler, Real Property Management - Operations
Stephen Gross, Public Works
Timothy Andrews, Court Administration
Jeffrey Adams, Court Administration

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
STEVE SISOLAK, Chairman « LARRY BROWN, Vice Chairman
SUSAN BRAGER + TOM COLLINS + CHRIS GIUNCHIGLIANI »+ MARY BETH SCOW + LAWRENCE WEEKLY
DONALD G. BURNETTE, County Manager



LOT1
Line Item No.

LOT 2
Line Item No.

4
5

LOT3
Line Item No.

7
8

LOT4
Line Item No.

10
11

12

BID 603346-14 BID TABULATION
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR KEYS, LOCKS AND LOCKSMITH SERVICES

Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount | Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $2,000.00 $2,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 59.00% $0.410 57.50% $0.425
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 59.00% $0.410 57.50% $0.425
LOT 1 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $2,000.82 $2,000.85
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $25,000.00 $25,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 57.50% $0.425 56.50% $0.435
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 57.50% $0.425 55.00% $0.450
LOT 2 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $25,000.85 $25,000.89
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $4,000.00 $4,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 51.00% $0.49 50.50% $0.495
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.00% $0.49 45.00% $0.55
LOT 3 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $4,000.98 $4,001.05
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $45,000.00 $45,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 55.50% $0.445 58.50% $0.415
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 55.50% $0.445 55.00% $0.450
LOT 4 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $45,000.89 $45,000.87
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Description

BID 603346-14 BID TABULATION
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR KEYS, LOCKS AND LOCKSMITH SERVICES

Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $50,000.00 $50,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 55.50% $0.45 56.00% $0.44
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 55.50% $0.45 52.50% $0.475
LOT 5 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: ~$50,000.89 $50,000.92
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $3,000.00 $3,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 60.00% $0.40 55.00% $0.45
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 60.00% $0.40 51.00% $0.49
LOT 6 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $3,000.80 $3,000.94
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $2,000.00 $2,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 50.50% $0.50 25.00% $0.75
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 50.50% $0.495 25.00% $0.75
LOT 7 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $2,000.99 $2,001.50
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $6,000.00 $6,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 50.50% $0.50 25.00% $0.75
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 50.50% $0.50 25.00% $0.75
LOT 8 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $6,000.99 $6,001.50
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Description

BID 603346-14 BID TABULATION
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR KEYS, LOCKS AND LOCKSMITH SERVICES

Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $4,000.00 $4,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 50.50% $0.50 25.00% $0.75
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 50.50% $0.50 25.00% $0.75
LOT 9 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $4,000.99 $4,001.50
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost :
$1.00 51.00% $0.49 43.00% $0.57
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.00% $0.49 40.00% $0.60
LOT 10 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $15,000.98 $15,001.17
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $82,500.00 $82,500.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 51.50% $0.49 50.50% $0.495
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.50% $0.49 45.00% $0.55
LOT 11 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $82,500.97 $82,501.05
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 59.00% $0.41 57.50% $0.425
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 59.00% $0.41 52.50% $0.475
LOT 12 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $15,000.82 $15,000.90
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Description

BID 603346-14 BID TABULATION
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR KEYS, LOCKS AND LOCKSMITH SERVICES

Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $2,000.00 $2,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 51.00% $0.49 52.00% $0.48
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.00% $0.49 45.00% $0.55
LOT 13 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $2,000.98 $2,001.03
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 60.00% $0.40 62.50% $0.375
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 60.00% $0.40 45.00% $0.55
LOT 14 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $15,000.80 $15,000.93
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $30,000.00 $30,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 60.00% $0.40 59.00% $0.41
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 45.00% $0.55 50.00% $0.50
LOT 15 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $30,000.95 $30,000.91
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $12,000.00 $12,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 55.00% $0.45 55.50% $0.445
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 55.00% $0.45 47.50% $0.525
LOT 16 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $12,000.90 $12,000.97
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BID 603346-14 BID TABULATION

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR KEYS, LOCKS AND LOCKSMITH SERVICES

|
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $40,000.00 $40,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 51.00% $0.49 47.50% $0.525
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.00% $0.49 45.00% $0.55
LOT 17 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $40,000.98 ‘ $40,001.08
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
% Discount Total Cost % Discount Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $50,000.00 $50,000.00
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
complete locks. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost
$1.00 51.00% $0.49 55.00% $0.45
Percentage discount off of manufacturer's list price for
parts. $1.00 x the % discount = Total Cost $1.00 51.00% $0.49 50.00% $0.50
LOT 18 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: $50,000.98 $50,000.95
Description Intermountain Lock & Security Clark Security Products
Total Cost Total Cost
Countywide estimated annual expenditure $220,000.00 $220,000.00
Straight Time Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid
Overtime and Saturdays Hourly Rate No Bid No Bid
Holidays Hourly Rate No Bid No §id
LOT 19 TOTAL COST BY VENDOR: No Bid No Bid




