Department of Administrative Services

Purchasing and Contracts

500 S Grand Central Pky 4th FI » Box 551217 « Las Vegas NV 89155-1217
(702) 455-2897 + Fax (702) 386-4914

Sabra Smith Newby, Chief Administrative Officer
Adleen B. Stidhum, Purchasing Manager
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NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO AWARD

SEPTEMBER 2, 2015

It is the intent of the Clark County Administrative Services Department, Purchasing and Contracts
Division, to recommend award of Bid No.603691-15, Annual Requirements Contract for; Lot 1 for
Purchase of Air Filters and Lot 2 for Purchase and Installation of Air Filters to Filtration Group dba
Filterworks for Lot 1 and KBAK dba Aire Filter Products for Lot 2 on October 6, 2015.

BID SUMMARY
LOT 1
Bids Received: Bid Amounts:
Filtration Group dba Filterworks (NBE) $255,843.91 *
KBAK dba Aire Filter Products (SBE) $282,713.34 *
Florence Filter Corporation (LBE) $287,472.50 *
Air Filter Sales & Service Co., Inc. (NBE) $374,267.20 *
LOT 2
Bids Received: Bid Amounts:
KBAK dba Aire Filter Products (SBE) $24,026.00
AAA Air Filter Co., Inc. (SBE) $27,752.24
Tri-Dim Filter Corporation (NBE) $31,425.44 *
Air Intake Replacement, Inc. (WBE) $42,487.56 *
Air Filter Sales & Service Co., Inc. (NBE) $55,399.92

* Denotes a corrected total

The bid received from Tri-Dim Filter Corporation for Lot 1 is being recommended for rejection for failure to
bid on all line items as required.

In accordance with the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document, all Bidders have five (5) business
days from receipt of this notification to submit a formal written protest to the Purchasing Analyst. The
Board of County Commissioners is not required to consider any protest that is not filed in accordance with
the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document.

DRIANE GARCIA, CPPB
Sr. Purchasing Analyst

Cc: Jerry Stueve, Real Property Management Lisa Kremer, Real Property Management
Darren Daniels, RPM — Operations Mark Larson, RPM — Operations
Matt Garban, RPM — Operations Wayne Wedlow, RPM — Operations
Pat Lachler, RPM — Operations Edward Munzing, Department of Aviation
Christine Grommons, LVCVA Natalie De Pina, Department of Aviation

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
STEVE SISOLAK, Chairman + LARRY BROWN, Vice Chairman
SUSAN BRAGER ¢« CHRIS GIUNCHIGLIANI + MARY BETH SCOW « LAWRENCE WEEKLY
DONALD G. BURNETTE, County Manager
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AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC.

UNIT COST
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NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

EXTENDED TOTAL
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NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE

UNIT COST
$3.20
$55.00
$3.90
$3.90
$4.20
$3.90
$4.20
$7.80
$7.80
$2.15
$3.90
$3.90
$3.90
$3.90
$2.40
$4.20
$4.20
$4.20
$7.80
$7.80
$3.90
$3.90
$2.50
$2.65
$4.80
$8.40
$8.40
$3.90
$3.90
$4.20
$3.90
$4.20
$2.85

EXTENDED TOTAL
$140.80
$55.00
$624.00
$46.80
$50.40
$23.40
$12.60
$62.40
$93.60
$68.80
$46.80
$39.00
$78.00
$226.20
$216.00
$84.00
$726.60
$184.80
$78.00
$436.80
$1,216.80
$39.00
$212.50
$26.50
$96.00
$84.00
$33.60
$468.00
$78.00
$16.80
$331.50
$50.40
$290.70

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
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AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC.
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NO BID
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NO BID
NOBID
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NO BID
NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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NO BID
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NO BID
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NO BID
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NOBID
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NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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NO BID
NO BID

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE

$2.95
$5.30
$4.20
$4.20
$2.60
$4.80
$5.30
$4.20
$4.20
$2.55
$4.80
$2.85
$5.30
$5.00
$4.20
$5.30
$5.30
$8.00
$8.00
$4.80
$10.60
$4.80
$3.20
$2.85
$5.70
$9.60
$4.80
$5.30
$5.70
$3.40
$5.30
$3.30
$3.45
$3.90
$5.30
$5.95
$3.80
$6.25
$6.25
$4.80
$10.60
$6.25
$3.60

$76.70
$307.40
$302.40
$84.00
$65.00
$144.00
$153.70
$588.00
$42.00
$244.80
$38.40
$986.10
$79.50
$20.00
$252.00
$63.60
$169.60
$192.00
$256.00
$153.60
$106.00
$240.00
$179.20
$285.00
$296.40
$38.40
$48.00
$1,166.00
$68.40
$2,788.00
$169.60
$79.20
$731.40
$132.60
$53.00
$119.00
$174.80
$75.00
$75.00
$19.20
$212.00
$75.00
$36.00

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT

NO BID
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BID NO. 603691-15
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS
BID TABULATION

AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC. AIR FILTER 5ALES & SERVICE AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
77 1378 NO BID NO BID $2.15 $2,962.70 NO BID NO BID
78 269 NO BID NO BID $2.35 $632.15 NO BID NO BID
79 10 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $42.50 NO BID NO BID
80 52 NO BID NO BID $2.40 $124.80 NO BID NO BID
81 10 NO BID NO BID $5.35 $53.50 NO BID NO BiD
82 22 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $93.50 NO BID NO BID
83 951 NO BID NO BID $2.05 $1,949.55 NO BID NO BID
84 48 NO BID NO BID $2.80 $134.40 NO BID NO BID
85 1018 NO BID NO BID $2.35 $2,392.30 NO BID NO BID
86 4 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $17.00 NO BID NO BID
87 2380 NO BID NO BID $5.05 $12,019.00 NO BID NO BID
88 10 NO BID NO BID $2.65 $26.50 NO BID NO BID
89 48 NO BID NO BID $5.05 $242.40 NO BID NO BID
90 33 NO BID NO BID $2.80 $92.40 NOBID NO BID
91 10 NO BID NO BID $8.40 $84.00 NO BID NO BID
92 12 NO BID NO BID $10.15 $121.80 NO BID NO BID
93 60 NO BID NO BID $5.80 $348.00 NO BID NO BID
94 5041 NO BID NO BID $2.45 $12,350.45 NO BID NO BID
95 6148 NO BID NO BID $2.80 $17,214.40 NOBID NO BID
9% 4082 NO BID NO BID $2.70 $11,021.40 NO BID NO BID
97 42 NO BID NO BID $6.10 $256.20 NO BID NO BID
98 12 NO BID NO BID $5.35 $64.20 NOBID NO BID
9 9784 NO BID NO BID $3.20 $31,308.80 NOBID NO BID
100 12 NO BID NO BID $3.70 $44.40 NO BID NO BID
101 12 NO BID NO BID $5.05 $60.60 NO BID NO BID
102 915 NO BID NO BID $3.85 $3,522.75 NO BID NO BID
103 24 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $103.20 NO BID NO BID
104 160 NO BID NO BID $5.30 $848.00 NOBID NO BID
105 6 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $25.80 NO BID NO BID
106 1495 NO BID NO BID $4.50 $6,727.50 NO BID NO BID
107 160 NO BID NO BID $11.75 $1,880.00 NO BID NO BID
108 40 NO BID NO BID $7.80 $312.00 NO BID NO BID
109 10 NO BID NO BID $4.20 $42.00 NO BID NO BID
110 5 NO BID NO BID $8.40 $42.00 NOBID NO BID
111 80 NO BID NO BID $11.75 $940.00 NO BID NO BID
112 10 NO BID NO BID $7.80 $78.00 NOBID NO BID
113 . 5 NO BID NO BID $3.90 $19.50 NOBID NO BID
114 5 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $21.25 NO BID NO BID
115 50 NO BID NO BID $5.30 $265.00 NO BID NO BID
116 10 NO BID NO BID $7.45 $74.50 NO BID NO BID
117 3618 NO BID NO BID $5.30 $19,175.40 NO BID NO BID
118 100 NO BID NOBID $10.55 $1,055.00 NO BID NO BID
119 30 NO BID NO BID $23.10 $693.00 NO BID NO BID
120 10 NO BID NO BID $4.40 $44.00 NO BID NO BID
121 20 NOBID NO BID $5.35 $107.00 NO BID NO BID
122 616 NO BID NO BID $5.30 $3,264.80 NO BID NO BID
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BID NO. 603691-15
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS
BID TABULATION

AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC. AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
123 40 NOBID NO BID $4.20 $168.00 NO BID NO BID
124 6912 NO BID NO BID $5.85 $40,435.20 NO BID NOBID
125 70 NO BID NO BID $3.90 $273.00 NOBID NOBID
126 5 NO BID NO BID $3.80 $19.00 NOBID NO BID
127 5 NOBID NO BID $4.20 $21.00 NO BID NOBID
128 2908 NOBID NO BID $5.30 $15,412.40 NO BID NOBID
129 100 NOBID NO BID $5.30 $530.00 NO BID NOBID
130 4 NOBID NO BID $28.00 $112.00 NO BID NO BID
131 24 NO BID NO BID $4.80 $115.20 NO BID NO BID
132 24 NO BID NO BID $2.60 $62.40 NO BID NO BID
133 48 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $206.40 NO BID NO BID
134 48 NO BID NO BID $4.80 $230.40 NO BID NO BID
135 1100 NO BID NO BID $24.25 $26,675.00 NO BID NO BID
136 750 NO BID NO BID $20.40 $15,300.00 NO BID NO BID
137 1800 NO BID NO BiD $20.80 $37,440.00 NO BID NO BID
138 180 NO BID NO BID $15.60 $2,808.00 NO BID NO BID
139 10 NO BID NO BID $13.50 $135.00 NO BID NO BID
140 200 NOBID NO BID $10.45 $2,090.00 NO BID NO BID
141 100 NO BID NO BID $12.85 $1,285.00 NO BID NO BID
142 160 NO BID NO BID $12.85 $2,056.00 NO BID NO BID
143 550 NO BID NO BID $14.40 $7,920.00 NO BID NO BID
144 30 NO BID NO BID $10.45 $313.50 NO BID NO BID
145 5 NO BID NO BID $7.70 $38.50 NO BID NO BID
146 15 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $535.50 NO BID NO BID
147 10 NO BID NO BID $41.85 $418.50 NO BID NO BID
148 10 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $357.00 NO BID NO BID
149 10 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $357.00 NO BID NO BID
150 10 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $357.00 NO BID NO BID
151 25 NO BID NO BID $50.45 $1,261.25 NO BID NO BID
152 25 NO BID NO BID $42.70 $1,067.50 NO BID NO BID
153 240 NO BID NO BID $13.50 $3,240.00 NO BiD NO BID
154 16 NOBID NO B8ID $19.00 $304.00 NO BID NO BID
155 132 NOBID NO BID $21.00 $2,772.00 NO BiID NO BID
156 3 NOBID NO BID $23.00 $69.00 NO BID NO BID
157 18 NO BID NO BID $14.50 $261.00 NO BID NOBID
158 24 NO BID NO BID $23.00 $552.00 NO BID NO BID
159 663 NO BID NO BID $24.00 $15,912.00 NO BID NO BID
160 16 NO BID NO BID $28.50 $456.00 NO BID NO BID
161 36 NO BID NO BID $25.00 $900.00 NO BID NO BID
162 480 NO BID NO BID $28.50 $13,680.00 NO BID NO BID
163 27600 NO BID NO BID $1.00 $27,600.00 NO BID NO BID
LOT 1 TOTALS: NOBID $374,267.20 NO BID
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BID NO. 603691-15
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS
BID TABULATION

AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC. AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
164 4 $27.90 $111.60 $27.12 $108.48 $52.16 $208.64
165 4 $70.41 $281.64 $205.26 $821.04 $143.23 $572.92
166 4 $65.02 $260.08 $135.52 $542.08 $104.04 $416.16
167 4 $163.65 $654.60 $388.61 $1,554.44 $247.39 $989.56
168 4 $125.21 $500.84 $301.42 $1,205.68 $199.27 $797.08
169 4 $36.98 $147.92 $41.10 $164.40 $62.00 $248.00
170 4 $173.09 $692.36 $440.96 $1,763.84 $246.65 $986.60
171 4 $228.00 $912.00 $548.00 $2,192.00 $334.20 $1,336.80
172 4 $108.45 $433.80 $244.17 $976.68 $167.99 $671.96
173 4 $130.53 $522.12 $291.43 $1,165.72 $195.66 $782.64
174 4 $220.64 $882.56 $659.59 $2,638.36 $345.50 $1,382.00
175 4 $108.60 $434.40 $251.88 $1,007.52 $171.62 $686.48
176 4 $55.81 $223.24 $75.90 $303.60 $75.97 $303.88
177 4 $71.21 $284.84 $103.02 $412.08 $89.13 $356.52
178 4 $71.68 $286.72 $109.60 $438.40 $98.04 $392.16
179 4 $67.55 $270.20 $97.70 $390.80 $85.76 $343.04
180 4 $33.22 $132.88 $35.80 $143.20 $57.43 $229.72
181 4 $45.14 $180.56 $54.80 $219.20 $68.52 $274.08
182 4 $137.96 $551.84 $326.48 $1,305.92 S 56 $842.64
183 4 $36.17 $144.68 $40.96 $163.84 $58.89 $235.56
184 4 $45.82 $183.28 $58.88 $235.52 $70.97 $283.88
185 4 $59.66 $238.64 $82.68 $330.72 $79.26 $317.04
186 4 $52.30 $209.20 $71.44 $285.76 $72.20 $288.80
187 4 $45.14 $180.56 $54.80 $219.20 $68.52 $274.08
188 4 $45.14 $180.56 $54.80 $219.20 $68.52 $274.08
189 4 $51.64 $206.56 $68.68 $274.72 $72.42 $289.68
190 4 $59.34 $237.36 $82.24 $328.96 $79.00 $316.00
191 4 $59.34 $237.36 $82.24 $328.96 $79.00 $316.00
192 4 $39.17 $156.68 $44.88 $179.52 $62.77 $251.08
193 4 $67.63 $270.52 $96.38 $385.52 $85.89 $343.56
194 4 $60.58 $242.32 $83.40 $333.60 $79.72 $318.88
195 4 $67.23 $268.92 $95.94 $383.76 $86.52 $346.08
196 4 $71.10 $284.40 $135.45 $541.80 $101.64 $406.56
197 4 $62.75 $251.00 $111.26 $445.04 $92.34 $369.36
198 4 $59.61 $238.44 $82.38 $329.52 $79.05 $316.20
199 4 $40.45 $161.80 $55.06 $220.24 $65.47 $261.88
200 4 $29.99 $119.96 $17.17 $68.68 $43.00 $172.00
201 4 $29.99 $119.96 $17.17 $68.68 $43.00 $172.00
202 4 $65.81 $263.24 $196.38 $785.52 $85.99 $343.96
203 4 $38.60 $154.40 $88.68 $354.72 $59.00 $236.00
204 4 $31.20 $124.80 $29.56 $118.24 $46.00 $184.00
205 4 $71.66 $286.64 $161.09 $644.36 $124.06 $496.24
206 4 $7.80 $31.20 $6.48 $25.92 $43.00 $172.00
207 4 $32.90 $131.60 $34.34 $137.36 $46.20 $184.80
208 4 $90.34 $361.36 $369.79 $1,479.16 $129.73 $518.92
209 4 $41.88 $167.52 $58.29 $233.16 $67.34 $269.36
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BID NO. 603691-15
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS
BID TABULATION

AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC. AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
210 4 $89.52 $358.08 $176.97 $707.88 $125.03 $500.12
211 4 $155.00 $620.00 $371.42 $1,485.68 $229.88 $919.52
212 4 $96.13 $384.52 $240.42 $961.68 $156.80 $627.20
213 4 $34.13 $136.52 $39.70 $158.80 $57.43 $229.72
214 4 $37.30 $149.20 $43.80 $175.20 $61.15 $244.60
215 4 $67.76 $271.04 $106.33 $425.32 $90.97 $363.88
216 4 $33.05 $132.20 $44.34 $177.36 $48.87 $195.48
217 4 $97.20 $388.80 $231.80 $927.20 $157.47 $629.88
218 4 $63.66 $254.64 $122.30 $489.20 $104.58 $418.32
219 4 $61.49 $245.96 $93.94 $375.76 $89.21 $356.84
220 4 $45.14 $180.56 $54.80 $219.20 $68.52 $274.08
221 4 $164.10 $656.40 $301.16 $1,204.64 $204.42 $817.68
222 4 $8.17 $32.68 $7.22 $28.88 $43.00 $172.00
223 4 $137.68 $550.72 $325.92 $1,303.68 $214.44 $857.76
224 4 $42.99 $171.96 $74.03 $296.12 $76.45 $305.80
225 4 $149.90 $599.60 $279.08 $1,116.32 $197.76 $791.04
226 4 $28.82 $115.28 $27.40 $109.60 $53.76 $215.04
227 4 $44.62 $178.48 $55.74 $222.96 $67.60 $270.40
228 4 $77.96 $311.84 $180.36 $721.44 $130.10 $520.40
229 4 $69.05 $276.20 $111.72 $446.88 $94.49 $377.96
230 4 $64.35 $257.40 $112.14 $448.56 $94.66 $378.64
231 4 $11.40 $45.60 $18.34 $73.36 $46.20 $184.80
232 4 $113.60 $454.40 $228.24 $912.96 $187.00 $748.00
233 4 $40.52 $162.08 $91.32 $365.28 $60.30 $241.20
234 4 $61.70 $246.80 $184.80 $739.20 $83.28 $333.12
235 4 $58.78 $235.12 $166.68 $666.72 $78.15 $312.60
236 4 $67.04 $268.16 $207.80 $831.20 $85.58 $342.32
237 4 $23.86 $95.44 $31.60 $126.40 $49.00 $196.00
238 4 $36.46 $145.84 $47.62 $190.48 $64.82 $259.28
239 4 $8.33 $33.32 $7.40 $29.60 $43.00 $172.00
240 4 $53.82 $215.28 $70.26 $281.04 $76.37 $305.48
241 4 $64.76 $259.04 $90.46 $361.84 $85.59 $342.36
242 4 $36.85 $147.40 $44.28 $177.12 $63.19 $252.76
243 4 $8.96 $35.84 $11.16 $44.64 $45.00 $180.00
244 4 $35.54 $142.16 $47.40 $189.60 $53.25 $213.00
245 4 $159.96 $639.84 $376.24 $1,504.96 $261.03 $1,044.12
246 4 $47.66 $190.64 $60.70 $242.80 $68.86 $275.44
247 4 $36.37 $145.48 $41.03 $164.12 $59.02 $236.08
248 4 $13.34 $53.36 $14.44 $57.76 $46.10 $184.40
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BID NO. 603691-15
ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS
BID TABULATION

AAA AIR FILTER CO. INC. AIR FILTER SALES & SERVICE AIR INTAKE REPLACEMENT
249 4 $7.85 $31.40 $6.78 $27.12 $42.29 $169.16
250 4 $101.66 $406.64 $257.64 $1,030.56 $164.04 $656.16
251 4 $8.70 $34.80 $9.17 $36.68 $42.60 $170.40
252 4 $13.60 $54.40 $14.80 $59.20 $47.46 $189.84
253 4 $14.10 $56.40 $27.51 $110.04 $49.50 $198.00
254 4 $66.00 $264.00 $121.86 $487.44 $97.73 $390.92
255 4 $8.68 $34.72 $7.80 $31.20 $43.75 $175.00
256 4 $8.70 $34.80 $9.17 $36.68 $42.60 $170.40
257 4 $18.19 $72.76 $32.80 $131.20 $49.20 $196.80
258 4 $188.18 $752.72 $482.78 $1,931.12 $281.48 $1,125.92
259 4 $64.97 $259.88 $115.58 $462.32 $97.49 $389.96
260 4 $42.96 $171.84 $69.80 $279.20 $74.74 $298.96
261 4 $146.08 $584.32 $307.80 $1,231.20 $139.20 $556.80
262 4 $152.18 $608.72 $302.25 $1,209.00 $129.15 $516.60
263 4 $69.68 $278.72 $131.00 $524.00 $72.90 $291.60
264 4 $33.38 $133.52 $37.90 $151.60 $52.60 $210.40
265 4 $34.46 $137.84 $22.50 $90.00 $47.90 $191.60
266 4 $58.47 $233.88 $88.54 $354.16 $64.63 $258.52
267 4 $73.90 $295.60 $278.18 $1,112.72 $186.52 $746.08
268 4 $75.06 $300.24 $166.98 $667.92 $129.06 $516.24
LOT 2 TOTALS: $27,752.24 $55,399.92 $42,487.56
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QUANTITY

44
1
160
12
12
6

3

8
12
32
12
10
20
58
90
20
173
44
10
56
312
10
85
10
20
10
4
120
20
4
85
12
102

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

UNIT COST
$3.20
$40.00
$2.00
$2.35
$2.00
$3.50
$3.50
$3.50
$2.80
$2.00
$2.80
$2.80
$2.80
$2.50
$1.88
$3.00
$1.80
$3.00
$4.00
$4.00
$1.60
$3.00
$1.75
$2.50
$2.40
$2.70
$4.50
$2.00
$2.50
$3.50
$2.78
$2.50
$2.05

EXTENDED TOTAL
$140.80
$40.00
$320.00
$28.20
$24.00
$21.00
$10.50
$28.00
$33.60
$64.00
$33.60
$28.00
$56.00
$145.00
$169.20
$60.00
$311.40
$132.00
$40.00
$224.00
$499.20
$30.00
$148.75
$25.00
$48.00
$27.00
$18.00
$240.00
$50.00
$14.00
$236.30
$30.00
$209.10

BID NO. 603691-15

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

UNIT COST
$3.00
$29.00
$1.80
$1.80
$2.80
$2.10
$2.80
$2.80
$3.00
$1.80
$2.10
$3.00
$3.00
$1.80
$1.80
$2.90
$2.00
$2.60
$2.80
$3.65
$1.97
$3.00
$2.10
$2.10
$2.10
$3.20
$2.80
$3.10
$3.40
$3.10
$3.50
$3.45
$2.10

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.

EXTENDED TOTAL
$132.00
$29.00
$288.00
$21.60
$33.60
$12.60
$8.40
$22.40
$36.00
$57.60
$25.20
$30.00
$60.00
$104.40
$162.00
$58.00
$346.00
$114.40
$28.00
$204.40
$614.64
$30.00
$178.50
$21.00
$42.00
$32.00
$11.20
$372.00
$68.00
$12.40
$297.50
$41.40
$214.20

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

UNIT COST
$2.99
$56.00
$2.45
$2.45
$4.88
$2.95
$3.40
$3.40
$3.40
$1.88
$2.15
$2.15
$2.25
$2.45
$2.15
$2.45
$2.45
$2.99
$2.99
$3.55
$1.70
$1.88
$1.88
$1.95
$2.99
$5.15
$5.15
$2.39
$2.15
$2.68
$2.15
$2.15
$2.20
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EXTENDED TOTAL
$420.99
$2,240.00
$784.00
$69.09
$117.12
$61.95
$35.70
$95.20
$114.24
$120.32
$72.24
$60.20
$126.00
$355.25
$363.78
$147.00
$762.93
$394.68
$119.60
$795.20
$848.64
$56.40
$279.65
$48.75
$143.52
$139.05
$92.70
$573.60
$107.50
$37.52
$508.05
$64.50
$460.02

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

UNIT COST
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED

EXTENDED TOTAL
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED



34
35
36
37
38
39

41
42
43

45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63

65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76

26
58
72
20
25
30
29
140
10
96

346
15

60
12
32
24
32
32
10
50
56
100
52

10
220
12
820
32
24
212

10
20
46
12
12

20
12
10

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

$2.55
$2.25
$2.50
$3.50
$2.15
$2.50
$2.50
$2.00
$3.45
$1.83
$2.90
$1.95
$2.40
$3.50
$3.15
$3.80
$2.80
$4.00
$4.00
$2.80
$4.50
$2.05
$2.48
$2.29
$3.15
$4.85
$3.05
$3.50
$4.50
$1.86
$3.70
$2.30
$2.13
$2.80
$3.50
$4.50
$2.50
$3.80
$4.15
$3.50
$4.50
$4.00
$2.80

$66.30
$130.50
$180.00
$70.00
$53.75
$75.00
$72.50
$280.00
$34.50
$175.68
$23.20
$674.70
$36.00
$14.00
$189.00
$45.60
$89.60
$96.00
$128.00
$89.60
$45.00
$102.50
$138.88
$229.00
$163.80
$19.40
$30.50
$770.00
$54.00
$1,525.20
$118.40
$55.20
$451.56
$95.20
$35.00
$90.00
$115.00
$45.60
$49.80
$14.00
$90.00
$48.00
$28.00

$2.10
$2.51
$2.85
$4.00
$3.10
$3.00
$2.99
$2.60
$3.50
$2.80
$3.20
$1.90
$3.10
$3.20
$3.60
$3.85
$4.10
$4.60
$3.20
$2.80
$3.50
$3.20
$3.10
$3.10
$3.60
$3.60
$4.60
$4.50
$4.30
$1.95
$3.85
$2.80
$2.00
$3.00
$3.00
$3.10
$2.50
$3.10
$4.10
$2.80
$3.50
$3.50
$2.90

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.
$54.60
$145.58
$205.20
$80.00
$77.50
$90.00
$86.71
$364.00
$35.00
$268.80
$25.60
$657.40
$46.50
$12.80
$216.00
$46.20
$131.20
$110.40
$102.40
$89.60
$35.00
$160.00
$173.60
$310.00
$187.20
$14.40
$46.00
$990.00
$51.60
$1,599.00
$123.20
$67.20
$424.00
$102.00
$30.00
$62.00
$115.00
$37.20
$49.20
$11.20
$70.00
$42.00
$29.00

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

$2.35
$2.50
$2.50
$2.69
$2.40
$2.55
$2.60
$2.17
$2.45
$1.90
$2.30
$1.95
$2.25
$2.40
$2.40
$2.40
$2.50
$3.50
$3.50
$2.80
$4.80
$2.30
$2.32
$2.32
$2.89
$4.85
$2.50
$2.45
$2.60
$1.90
$2.49
$2.49
$2.15
$2.45
$2.88
$3.78
$2.59
$2.99
$2.99
$3.15
$5.75
$2.99
$1.99
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$155.81
$326.25
$450.00
$188.30
$129.00
$191.25
$188.50
$607.60
$84.53
$333.79
$53.36
$1,315.67
$81.00
$33.60
$453.60
$109.44
$224.00
$336.00
$448.00
$250.88
$216.00
$235.75
$322.20
$531.28
$473.38
$94.09
$76.25
$1,886.50
$140.40
$2,897.88
$294.82
$137.45
$970.85
$233.24
$100.80
$340.20
$297.85
$136.34
$148.90
$44.10
$517.50
$143.52
$55.72

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED



77
78
79

81
82
83

85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93

95

9%

97

98

99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118
119
120
121
122

1378
269
10
52
10
22
951
48
1018

2380
10
48
33
10
12

5041
6148
4082
42
12
9784
12
12
915
24
160

1495
160

3618
100
30
10
20
616

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

$1.70
$2.05
$3.80
$1.94
$3.80
$1.95
$1.84
$2.50
$2.05
$4.25
$1.95
$2.58
$3.00
$2.55
$4.00
$5.50
$5.10
$2.03

$2.25
$3.25
$4.00
$2.55
$3.35
$3.35
$3.10
$4.85
$4.50
$4.85
$3.50
$4.00
$4.55
$3.50
$4.25
$5.30
$3.60
$3.00
$3.60
$3.80
$5.00
$3.50
$3.10
$12.00
$2.85
$3.85
$4.30

$2,342.60
$551.45
$38.00
$100.88
$38.00
$42.90
$1,749.84
$120.00
$2,086.90
$17.00
$4,641.00
$25.80
$144.00
$84.15
$40.00
$66.00
$306.00
$10,233.23
$13,525.60
$9,184.50
$136.50
$48.00
$24,949.20
$40.20
$40.20
$2,836.50
$116.40
$720.00
$29.10
$5,232.50
$640.00
$182.00
$35.00
$21.25
$424.00
$36.00
$15.00
$18.00
$190.00
$50.00
$12,663.00
$310.00
$360.00
$28.50
$77.00
$2,648.80

$2.02
$2.15
$3.95
$2.07
$2.00
$2.66
$2.00
$2.40
$2.10
$2.10
$3.10
$2.75
$2.75
$2.95
$4.71
$4.00
$4.00
$2.18
$2.63
$2.45
$3.60
$8.00
$2.75
$3.45
$3.10
$3.40
$3.29
$4.45
$3.29
$4.25
$4.90
$2.50
$2.20
$3.00
$5.50
$2.50
$2.80
$2.80
$4.80
$3.10
$4.05
$4.40
$4.80
$3.10
$3.50
$4.40

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.

$2,783.56
$578.35
$39.50
$107.64
$20.00
$58.52
$1,902.00
$115.20
$2,137.80
$8.40
$7,378.00
$27.50
$132.00
$97.35
$47.10
$48.00
$240.00
$10,989.38
$16,169.24
$10,000.90
$151.20
$96.00
$26,906.00
$41.40
$37.20
$3,111.00
$78.96
$712.00
$19.74
$6,353.75
$784.00
$100.00
$22.00
$15.00
$440.00
$25.00
$14.00
$14.00
$240.00
$31.00
$14,652.90
$440.00
$144.00
$31.00
$70.00
$2,710.40

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

$1.75
$2.15
$2.40
$2.30
$3.45
$2.40
$1.82
$2.30
$2.02
$2.60
$2.65
$2.30
$2.30
$2.30
$4.77
$5.88
$4.88
$1.99
$2.15
$2.15
$3.05
$3.65
$2.35
$2.99
$3.25
$3.30
$3.90
$4.05
$3.90
$4.20
$4.80
$3.90
$2.60
$3.15
$5.60
$3.05
$2.70
$2.90
$2.90
$3.09
$5.30
$5.05
$7.19
$3.05
$3.30
$4.50
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$4,099.55
$1,185.62
$91.20
$232.02
$131.10
$102.96
$3,184.71
$276.00
$4,215.54
$44.20
$12,298.65
$59.34
$331.20
$193.55
$190.80
$388.08
$1,493.28
$20,364.13
$29,080.04
$19,746.68
$416.33
$175.20
$58,630.62
$120.20
$130.65
$9,360.45
$453.96
$2,916.00
$113.49
$21,976.50
$3,072.00
$709.80
$91.00
$66.94
$2,374.40
$109.80
$40.50
$52.20
$551.00
$154.50
$67,113.90
$1,565.50
$2,588.40
$86.93
$254.10
$11,919.60

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REIECTED
REIECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED



123
124
125
126
127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134
135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
LOT 1 TOTALS:

6912
70

2908
100

24
24
48
48
1100
750
1800
180
10
200
100
160
550
30

15
10
10
10
10
25
25
240
16
132

18

24
663
16

36
480
27600

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

$3.50
$4.50
$3.50
$4.00
$3.50
$4.30
$4.35
$2.00
$4.15
$2.10
$3.70
$3.00
$15.25
$11.45
$13.60
$8.68
$8.50
$5.15
$5.85
$6.00
$6.65
$5.80
$6.00
$18.00
$26.50
$24.00
$24.00
$18.00
$26.50
$26.00
$10.00
$17.50
$15.65
$19.50
$13.60
$16.50
$15.35
$22.50
$17.80
$16.54
$1.00

$140.00
$31,104.00
$245.00
$20.00
$17.50
$12,504.40
$435.00
$8.00
$99.60
$50.40
$177.60
$144.00
$16,775.00
$8,587.50
$24,480.00
$1,562.40
$85.00
$1,030.00
$585.00
$960.00
$3,657.50
$174.00
$30.00
$270.00
$265.00
$240.00
$240.00
$180.00
$662.50
$650.00
$2,400.00
$280.00
$2,065.80
$58.50
$244.80
$396.00
$10,177.05
$360.00
$640.80
$7,939.20
$27,600.00
$255,843.91

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

$2.80
$4.80
$1.80
$1.80
$2.80
$4.40
$4.40
$6.20
$3.20
$2.15
$2.15
$2.55
$14.00
$13.80
$13.45
$18.80
$4.40
$5.36
$5.71
$6.29
$7.06
$5.18
$5.75
$28.45
$28.45
$28.45
$28.45
$39.50
$28.00
$43.00
$13.50
$35.00
$30.00
$30.00
$35.00
$25.00
$14.00
$25.00
$28.00
$25.00
$1.00

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.

$112.00
$33,177.60
$126.00
$9.00
$14.00
$12,795.20
$440.00
$24.80
$76.80
$51.60
$103.20
$122.40
$15,400.00
$10,350.00
$24,210.00
$3,384.00
$44.00
$1,072.00
$571.00
$1,006.40
$3,883.00
$155.40
$28.75
$426.75
$284.50
$284.50
$284.50
$395.00
$700.00
$1,075.00
$3,240.00
$560.00
$3,960.00
$90.00
$630.00
$600.00
$9,282.00
$400.00
$1,008.00
$12,000.00
$27,600.00
$287,472.50

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

$3.11
$4.80
$2.90
$3.18
$2.88
$4.50
$4.50
$5.18
$5.11
$2.60
$2.60
$2.99
$16.15
$13.90
$14.25
$13.70
$8.24
$5.11
$5.84
$5.90
$6.25
$4.99
$3.60
$28.14
$35.00
$28.00
$28.00
$28.00
$37.00
$37.00
$14.25
$15.30
$15.40
$14.35
$13.79
$14.35
$16.25
$18.70
$18.60
$19.85
$1.00
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$435.40
$149,299.20
$710.50
$63.60
$50.40
$56,269.80
$1,957.50
$41.44
$508.96
$131.04
$461.76
$430.56
$270,916.25
$119,366.25
$348,840.00
$21,404.88
$700.40
$5,263.30
$3,416.40
$5,664.00
$22,859.38
$868.26
$108.00
$7,597.80
$9,275.00
$6,720.00
$6,720.00
$5,040.00
$24,512.50
$24,050.00
$34,200.00
$4,284.00
$31,813.32
$839.48
$3,375.79
$5,682.60
$165,377.06
$6,732.00
$11,918.88
$157,593.12
$27,600.00
$1,852,722.39

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED

REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED
REJECTED



164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184
185
186
187
188
189
190
191
192
193
194
195
196
197
198
199
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209

B A B DDA DLBEDLEDLEDDDLDEDLDLEDLEDLDLDDLDLDEDLEDDLDBLEDLADLDEDLLAEDLDDLEDLDLLDLDDEDLDLDLLDN

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BID NO. 603691-15

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

$33.50
$102.50
$73

$189.00
$155.00
$33.50
$189.00
$194.00
$115.00
$135.00
$215.00
$94.00
$33.50
$38.00
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$97.00
$33.50
$37.00
$33.50
$37.00
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$33.50
$36.00
$37.00
$37.00
$37.00
$33.50
$25.00
$25.00
$33.50
$25.00
$25.00
$63.00
$25.00
$25.00
$57.00
$37.00
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$134.00
$410.00
$292.00
$756.00
$620.00
$134.00
$756.00
$776.00
$460.00
$540.00
$860.00
$376.00
$134.00
$152.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$388.00
$134.00
$148.00
$134.00
$148.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$134.00
$144.00
$148.00
$148.00
$148.00
$134.00
$100.00
$100.00
$134.00
$100.00
$100.00
$252.00
$100.00
$100.00
$228.00
$148.00

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

$43.52
$132.75
$67.88
$186.08
$142.07
$47.78
$178.88
$245.40
$115.27
$133.85
$325.46
$120.22
$58.97
$67.49
$69.08
$65.41
$51.38
$52.04
$141.78
$49.54
$62.49
$61.10
$57.00
$52.04
$52.04
$56.66
$60.92
$60.92
$51.82
$118.73
$61.70
$65.19
$92.37
$69.67
$62.47
$49.55
$38.88
$38.88
$64.33
$47.78
$39.26
$95.23
$38.50
$40.30
$97.75
$56.58

$174.08
$531.00
$271.52
$744.32
$568.28
$191.12
$715.52
$981.60
$461.08
$535.40
$1,301.84
$480.88
$235.88
$269.96
$276.32
$261.64
$205.52
$208.16
$567.12
$198.16
$249.96
$244.40
$228.00
$208.16
$208.16
$226.64
$243.68
$243.68
$207.28
$474.92
$246.80
$260.76
$369.48
$278.68
$249.88
$198.20
$155.52
$15552
$257.32
$191.12
$157.04
$380.92
$154.00
$161.20
$391.00
$226.32






249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261
262
263
264
265
266
267
268
LOT 2 TOTALS:

A A A DALAELEDLDLEDLEDLEDLDLEDLELDLDLEDLLN

FILTRATION GROUP dba FILTERWORKS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID

BID NO. 603691-15

ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT; LOT 1 FOR PURCHASE OF AIR FILTERS AND LOT 2 FOR PURCHASE AND INSTALLATION OF AIR FILTERS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NOBID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

FLORENCE FILTER CORP.

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BID TABULATION

KBAK dba AIRE FILTER PRODUCTS

$25.00
$110.00
$25.00
$25.00
$25.00
$37.00
$25.00
$25.00
$25.00
$194.00
$45.00
$45.00
$60.00
$75.00
$44.00
$37.00
$37.00
$45.00
$110.00
$58.00
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$100.00
$440.00
$100.00
$100.00
$100.00
$148.00
$100.00
$100.00
$100.00
$776.00
$180.00
$180.00
$240.00
$300.00
$176.00
$148.00
$148.00
$180.00
$440.00
$232.00
$24,026.00

TRI-DIM FILTER CORP.

$37.13
$125.94
$37.65

$39.44

$55.04

$76.16

$37.50

$37.65

$41.62

$148.74
$80.84

$57.18
$204.52
$194.74
$73.76

$58.95

$43.32

$62.31

$128.04
$87.26

$148.52
$503.76
$150.60
$157.76
$220.16
$304.64
$150.00
$150.60
$166.48
$594.96
$323.36
$228.72
$818.08
$778.96
$295.04
$235.80
$173.28
$249.24
$512.16
$349.04
$31,425.44





