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Sabra Smith Newby, Chief Administrative Officer 
Adleen B. Stidhum, Purchasing Manager 

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO AWARD 

NOVEMBER 15, 2015 

It is the intent of the Clark County Administrative Services Department, Purchasing and Contracts 
Division, to recommend award of Bid No.603806-15, Annual Requirements Contract for Pool Chemicals; 
Lot 1 to Thatcher Company of Nevada, Inc. and Lot 2 to Helget Gas dba Speedy Fountain Service on 
December 15, 2015. 

BID SUMMARY 

LOT 1 

Bids Received: 
White Wolf Enterprises, Inc. dba Captain Chemical 
Thatcher Company of Nevada, Inc. 

LOT2 

Bids Received: 
Helget Gas dba Speedy Fountain Service 

*Denotes a corrected total 

Bid Amounts: 
$508,187.50 * 
$606,045.00 

Bid Amounts: 
$24,000.00 

The bid received from White Wolf Enterprises, Inc. dba Captain Chemical is being recommended for 
rejection for failure to use the correct Bid Form and exceptions taken to the terms of the contract. 

In accordance with the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document, all Bidders have five (5) business 
days from receipt of this notification to submit a formal written protest to the Purchasing Analyst. The 
Board of County Commissioners is not required to consider any protest that is not filed in accordance with 
the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document. 

If you have any questions c ncerning this notification, please contact Adriane Garcia, Sr. Purchasing 
Analyst, at (702) 455-273 

ADRIANE GARCIA, CPPB 
Sr. Purchasing Analyst 

Cc: Jerry Stueve, Real Property Management 
Lisa Kremer, Real Property Management 
Darren Daniels , Real Property Management - Operations 
Mark Larson, Real Property Management - Operations 
Matt Garban, Real Property Management - Operations 
Wayne Wedlow, Real Property Management - Operations 
Pat Lachler, Real Property Management - Operations 
Stephen Gross, Public Works 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
STEVE SISOLAK, Chairman • LARRY BROWN , Vice Cha irman 

SUSAN BRAGER • CHRIS GIUNCHIGLIANI • MARILYN KIRKPATRICK • MARY BETH SCOW • LAWRENCE WEEKLY 
DONALD G. BURNETTE, County Manager 



Line Item No. 

LOTl 

Quantity 

1 200,000 

2 7S 
3 so 
4 so 

I 5 60,000 

6 so I 
7 1,000 

8 100 

9 200 

10 400 

11 100 
12 1 
13 1 

LOT 1 TOTAL 

LOT2 

14 100,000 

LOT 2 TOTAL 

BID 603806-lS ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR POOL CHEMICALS 

Helget Gas dba Speedy Fountain Service Thatcher Company of Nevada, Inc. 

Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total 

NO BID NO BID $1.34 $268,000.00 

NOBID NO BID $38.10 $2,857.50 
NOBID NO BID $101.20 $S,060.00 
NO BID NO BID $63.7S $3,187.50 

NO BID NO BID $1.80 $107,940.00 

NO BID NO BID $149.00 $7,4SO.OO 
NO BID NO BID $27.4S $27,4SO.OO 

NO BID NO BID $289.00 $28,900.00 

NO BID NO BID $45.00 $9,000.00 

NO BID NO BID $300.00 $120,000.00 
NO BID NO BID $1S2.00 $15,200.00 
NO BID NO BID $1,000.00 $1,000.00 
NO BID NO BID $10,000.00 $10,000.00 

NOBID $606,045.00 

$0.24 $24,000.00 NO BID NO BID 

$24,000.00 NOBID 

White Wolf Enterprises, Inc. dba 

Captain Chemical 

Unit Price Extended Total 

$1.10 $220,000.00 

$31.50 $2,362.50 
$82.SO $4,12S.OO 
$24.00 $1,200.00 

$1.60 $96,000.00 

$88.00 $4,400.00 
$23.50 $23,SOO.OO 

$2SO.OO $2S,OOO.OO 

$40.SO $8,100.00 

$2SO.OO $100,000.00 
$125.00 $12,SOO.OO 

$1,000.00 $1,000.00 
$10,000.00 $10,000.00 

$508,187.50 

NO BID NO BID 

NOBID 




