BID NO. 603826-15

PROJECT DESCRIPTION: ANNUAL REQUIREMENTS CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF METAL
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 27, 2015

H.E.P., INC., dba

HD SUPPLY

P & S METALS STEEL EDGE, INC. WATERWORKS,

LOT 1 TOTAL $373,783.82 NO BID NO BID

LOT 2 TOTAL $119,442.10 NO BID NO BID

LOT 3 TOTAL NO BID $10,408.75 NO BID

LOT 4 TOTAL $44,936.00 NO BID NO BID

LOT 5 TOTAL $6,994.00 NO BID NO BID

LOT 6 TOTAL $101,064.00 NO BID $84,992.00

* Numbers in red are correcte
H.E.P.,INC.,dba P & S METALS
LOT 1
Item ASTM
No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
PLATE
1 A786 Floor, 1/8"x 4' x 10* Each 10 $106.30 $1,063.00
2 A786 Floor, 3/8”, 8' x 10’ Each 6 $735.60 $4,413.60
3 A786 Floor, ¥2", 8' x 20’ Each 9 $2,372.45 $21,352.05
4 A786 Floor, 5/8”, 8' x 10’ Each 3 $1,973.20 $5,919.60
5 A786 Floor, 3/4"x 8' x 20’ Each 3 $3,896.50 $11,689.50
6 A786 Floor, 14 gauge, 4'ft X 10' ft hot roll Each 8 $51.70 $413.60
7 A786 Floor, 3/16", 4'ft X 10' ft hot roll Each 6 $150.30 $901.80
8 A786 Floor, 1/4", 4'ft X 10" ft hot roll Each 6 $194.30 $1,165.80
9 A36 Hot Rolled, 1/8”, 6’ x 8’ Each 8 $120.00 $960.00
10 A36 Hot Rolled, %", 8’ x 8’ Each 10 $273.25 $2,732.50
11 A36 Hot Rolled, 1/8”, 6’ x 10’ Each 12 $150.00 $1,800.00
12 A36 Hot Rolled, ¥4", 8’ x 10’ Each 6 $341.52 $2,049.12
13 A36 Hot Rolled, 1", 8 x 10’ Each 3 $1,366.10 $4,098.30
14 A36 Hot Rolled, 3/16", 8' X 10* Each 3 $306.40 $919.20
15 A514 AR 400, 1/2", 8" x 10’ Sheet Each 4 $1,622.70 $6,490.80
16 A514 T-1 Plate 1/2 inch, 8' x 10' Each 3 $1,352.75 $4,058.25
17 A786 Floor, 12 ga,4' x 8' Each 10 $72.50 $725.00
18 1008 4' x 10' 10 Gauge Cold Roll Sheet Each 5 $97.10 $485.50
19 1008 4' x 10' 16 Gauge Cold Roll Sheet Each 5 $43.15 $215.75
TUBE (HOT ROLLED)

20 A513 Square, 2" x .065, 20’ Each 306 $3.70 $1,132.20
21 A513 Square, %" x .065, 20’ Each 231 $5.65 $1,305.15
22 A513 Square, 1” x .065, 20’ Each 366 $6.50 $2,379.00
23 A513 Square, 1 %" x .065, 20 Each 216 $10.00 $2,160.00
24 A513 Square, 1 %" x .065, 20’ Each 291 $9.90 $2,880.90
25 A513 Square, 2” x .065, 20’ Each 266 $16.00 $4,256.00
26 A513 Square, %" x .120, 20’ Each 76 $11.30 $858.80
27 A513 Square, 1" x .095, 20’ Each 311 $9.50 $2,954.50
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28 A513 Square, 1 %" x .095, 20’ Each 341 $14.75 $5,029.75
29 A513 Square, 1 %" x .095, 20’ Each 341 $17.55 $5,984.55
30 A513 Square, 2" x .095, 20 Each 191 $23.65 $4,517.15
31 A513 Square, 1" x .120, 20’ Each 146 $14.75 $2,153.50
32 A513 Square, 1 %" x .120, 20’ Each 166 $18.85 $3,129.10
33 A513 Square, 1 %" x .120, 20’ Each 191 $22.95 $4,383.45
34 A513 Square, 2" x .120, 20’ Each 76 $29.00 $2,204.00
35 A513 Square, 3 1/2" X 3/16", 20' Each 31 $79.25 $2,456.75
36 A513 Square, 312" x 3/16", 40’ Each 21 $158.50 $3,328.50
37 A513 Square, 3 %" x ¥4", 40 Each 31 $204.35 $6,334.85
38 A513 Square, 4" X ¥", 40 Each 16 $237.40 $3,798.40
39 A513 Square, 1/2" x .095, 20" Each 26 $5.55 $144.30
40 A513 Square, 1/2" x .120, 20 Each 26 $7.40 $192.40
41 A513 Square, 5/8" x .065, 20’ Each 36 $4.30 $154.80
42 A513 Square, 5/8" x .095, 20 Each 36 $6.45 $232.20
43 A513 Square, 5/8" x .120, 20’ Each 36 $8.60 $309.60
44 A513 Square, 3/4" x .120, 20 Each 36 $11.30 $406.80
45 A513 Square, 2 1/2" x .120, 20' Each 31 $36.65 $1,136.15
46 A513 Square, 3" x .065, 20 Each 21 $25.50 $535.50
47 A513 Square, 3" x .095, 20 Each 21 $35.10 $737.10
48 A513 Square, 3" x .120, 20 Each 21 $44.45 $933.45
49 A513 Square, 3 1/2"x .065, 20' Each 21 $29.20 $613.20
50 A513 Square, 3 1/2" x .095, 20' Each 21 $31.05 $652.05
51 A513 Square, 3 1/2" x .120, 20' Each 21 $52.60 $1,104.60
52 A513 Square, 4" x .065, 20 Each 21 $32.00 $672.00
53 A513 Square, 4" x .065, 40 Each 21 $64.00 $1,344.00
54 A513 Square, 4" x .095, 20 Each 21 $49.40 $1,037.40
55 A513 Square, 4" x .095, 40 Each 21 $98.80 $2,074.80
56 A513 Square, 4" x .120, 20 Each 21 $60.40 $1,268.40
57 A513 Square, 4" x .120, 40 Each 21 $120.80 $2,536.80
58 A513 Square, 4" x 3/16", 20' Each 21 $91.60 $1,923.60
59 A513 Square, 4" x 3/16", 40' Each 21 $183.20 $3,847.20
60 A513 Square, 4" x 1/4", 20' Each 21 $118.70 $2,492.70
61 A513 Square, 4" x 1/4, 40’ Each 21 $237.40 $4,985.40
62 A513 Rectangle, 1" x 2", .095, 20' Each 181 $17.50 $3,167.50
63 A513 Rectangle, 2" x 4", .095, 20' Each 131 $38.60 $5,056.60
64 A513 Rectangle, 1" x 2", .065, 20’ Each 76 $11.90 $904.40
65 A513 Rectangle, 1” x 2", .120, 20’ Each 51 $22.95 $1,170.45
66 A513 Rectangle, 2" x 4", .120, 20’ Each 51 $44.45 $2,266.95
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67 A513 Rectangle, 2" x 6”, .120, 20’ Each 36 $60.40 $2,174.40
68 A513 Round, 1" x .065, 20’ Each 86 $6.75 $580.50
69 A513 Round, 1 2" x .065, 20’ Each 156 $10.95 $1,708.20
70 A513 Round, 1/2" x .065, 20’ Each 31 $4.00 $124.00
71 A513 Round, 1/2" x .095, 20’ Each 31 $25.00 $775.00
72 A513 Round, 1/2" x .120, 20’ Each 31 $28.50 $883.50
73 A513 Round, 3/4" x .065, 20' Each 31 $6.30 $195.30
74 A513 Round, 3/4" x .095, 20’ Each 31 $12.50 $387.50
75 A513 Round, 3/4" x .120, 20' Each 31 $10.70 $331.70
76 A513 Round, 5/8" x .065, 20' Each 26 $5.15 $133.90
77 A513 Round, 5/8" x .095, 20’ Each 26 $26.75 $695.50
78 A513 Round, 5/8" x .120, 20’ Each 26 $8.55 $222.30
79 A513 Round, 1" x .065, 20 Each 26 $7.15 $185.90
80 A513 Round, 1" x .095, 20" Each 26 $12.15 $315.90
81 A513 Round, 1" x .120, 20 Each 26 $14.90 $387.40
82 A513 Round, 1 1/4" x .065, 20' Each 26 $10.85 $282.10
83 A513 Round, 1 1/4" x .095, 20' Each 26 $15.50 $403.00
84 A513 Round, 1 1/4" x .120, 20' Each 26 $19.15 $497.90
85 A513 Round, 1 1/2" x .065, 20' Each 26 $13.20 $343.20
86 A513 Round, 1 1/2" x .095, 20' Each 26 $18.85 $490.10
87 A513 Round, 1 1/2" x .120, 20' Each 26 $24.35 $633.10
88 A513 Round, 1 3/4" x .065, 20' Each 26 $15.05 $391.30
89 A513 Round, 1 3/4" x .095, 20' Each 26 $22.15 $575.90
90 A513 Round, 1 3/4" x .120, 20' Each 26 $28.75 $747.50
91 A513 Round, 1 7/8" x .065, 20' Each 26 $18.65 $484.90
92 A513 Round, 1 7/8" x .095, 20' Each 26 $63.00 $1,638.00
93 A513 Round, 1 7/8" x .120, 20' Each 26 $75.00 $1,950.00
94 A513 Round, 2" x .065, 20' Each 26 $17.75 $461.50
95 A513 Round, 2" x .095, 20 Each 26 $23.90 $621.40
96 A513 Round, 2" x .120, 20' Each 26 $31.80 $826.80
97 A513 Round, 2 1/4" x .065, 20' Each 26 $22.65 $588.90
98 A513 Round, 2 1/4" x .095, 20' Each 26 $37.25 $968.50
99 A513 Round, 2 1/4" x .120, 20' Each 26 $52.50 $1,365.00
100 A513 Round, 2 1/2" x .065, 20' Each 26 $20.65 $536.90
101 A513 Round, 2 1/2" x .095, 20' Each 26 $41.00 $1,066.00
102 A513 Round, 2 1/2" x .120, 20' Each 26 $41.95 $1,090.70
103 A513 Round, 2 3/4" x .065, 20' Each 26 $65.75 $1,709.50
104 A513 Round, 2 3/4" x .095, 20' Each 26 $94.00 $2,444.00
105 A513 Round, 2 3/4" x .120, 20' Each 26 $114.75 $2,983.50
106 A513 Round, 3" x .065, 20' Each 26 $26.95 $700.70
107 A513 Round, 3" x .095, 20 Each 26 $50.50 $1,313.00
108 A513 Round, 3" x .120, 20' Each 26 $47.95 $1,246.70
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TUBE
109 A513 Square, 1/2" x .095, 20* Each 11 $5.55 $61.05
110 A513 Square, 1/2" x 1/8", 20’ Each 11 $7.40 $81.40
111 A513 Round, 1/2" x .095, 20" Each 11 $5.55 $61.05
112 A513 Round, 1/2" x 1/8", 20’ Each 11 $7.40 $81.40
113 A513 Round, 1" x .095, 20' Each 14 $12.15 $170.10
114 A513 Round, 1" x 1/8", 20" Each 11 $15.65 $172.15
115 A513 Round, 1 1/2" x .095, 20' Each 14 $18.80 $263.20
116 A513 Round, 1 1/2" x 1/8", 20’ Each 11 $24.55 $270.05
117 A513 Round, 2" x .095, 20' Each 14 $25.45 $356.30
118 A513 Round, 2" x 1/8", 20" Each 11 $33.35 $366.85
119 A513 Round, 2 1/2" x .095, 20' Each 11 $29.15 $320.65
120 A513 Round, 2 1/2" x 1/8", 20’ Each 11 $42.30 $465.30
ANGLE (HOT ROLLED)

121 A36 1/2" X 1/2" X 1/8", 20' Each 161 $5.40 $869.40
122 A36 1" X 1" X 1/8", 20 Each 261 $7.70 $2,009.70
123 A36 142" x 1 %" x 1/8”, 20’ Each 161 $11.85 $1,907.85
124 A36 1Y% x 19" x Y4, 20’ Each 36 $22.45 $808.20
125 A36 2" x 2" x 1/8", 20° Each 226 $15.85 $3,582.10
126 A36 2" X 2" X Y4, 20’ Each 176 $30.65 $5,394.40
127 A36 2" x 3" XY, 20° Each 46 $50.45 $2,320.70
128 A36 2" X 2" X 3/16", 20’ Each 161 $23.45 $3,775.45
129 A36 3" X 3" X 3/16" 20’ Each 51 $35.65 $1,818.15
130 A36 3" X 3" X 1/4", 20" Each 56 $47.05 $2,634.80
131 A36 3 %" x 3% x 3/8", 20’ Each 36 $91.80 $3,304.80
132 A36 4" X 4" X 1/4", 20' Each 31 $66.00 $2,046.00
133 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x .120, 20' Each 36 $7.80 $280.80
134 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x 1/8", 20" Each 36 $7.80 $280.80
135 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x 1/4", 20’ Each 36 $15.60 $561.60
136 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x 3/16", 20' Each 36 $11.70 $421.20
137 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x 3/8", 20’ Each 36 $23.40 $842.40
138 A36 3/4" x 3/4" x 1/2", 20' Each 36 $31.20 $1,123.20
139 A36 3" x 3" x .065, 20 Each 26 $26.40 $686.40
140 A36 3" x 3" x.095, 20 Each 26 $43.65 $1,134.90
141 A36 3" x 3" x.120, 20" Each 26 $53.75 $1,397.50
142 A36 3" x 3" x 3/16, 20 Each 26 $35.65 $926.90
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143 A36 3" x3"x 1/4", 20" Each 26 $47.05 $1,223.30
144 A36 3" x 3" x 5/16", 20' Each 26 $54.90 $1,427.40
145 A36 3" x 3" x3/8", 20" Each 26 $69.15 $1,797.90
146 A36 3" x3"x 1/2", 20' Each 26 $90.25 $2,346.50
147 A36 4" x 4" x .065, 20' Each 26 $36.55 $950.30
148 A36 4" x 4" x.095, 20' Each 26 $58.95 $1,532.70
149 A36 4" x 4" x.120, 20' Each 26 $73.05 $1,899.30
150 A36 4" x 4" x 1/8", 20' Each 26 $73.05 $1,899.30
151 A36 4" x 4" x1/4", 20’ Each 26 $63.35 $1,647.10
152 A36 4" x 4" x 5/16", 20 Each 26 $88.60 $2,303.60
153 A36 4" x 4" x 3/8", 20' Each 26 $94.10 $2,446.60
154 A36 4" x 4" x 1/2", 20' Each 26 $122.90 $3,195.40
155 A36 2 1/2" x 2 1/2" x .065, 20 Each 26 $7.90 $205.40
156 A36 21/2"x 2 1/2" x .095, 20 Each 26 $35.85 $932.10
157 A36 21/2"x 2 1/2" x.120, 20' Each 26 $15.85 $412.10
158 A36 21/2"x21/2" x 3/16", 20' Each 26 $29.50 $767.00
159 A36 21/2"x21/2" x 1/4", 20' Each 26 $43.90 $1,141.40
160 A36 21/2"x 2 1/2" x 5/16", 20' Each 26 $50.00 $1,300.00
161 A36 21/2"x21/2" x 3/8", 20" Each 26 $56.65 $1,472.90
162 A36 21/2"x21/2"x 1/2", 20" Each 26 $73.95 $1,922.70
163 A36 1" x 1" x 3/16", 20’ Each 11 $11.15 $122.65
164 A36 1"x 1" x 1/4", 20' Each 11 $14.30 $157.30

BAR (SOLID, HOT ROLLED)
165 A36 Square, %", 20’ Each 71 $8.60 $610.60
166 A36 Square, 5/8”, 20’ Each 31 $13.45 $416.95
167 A36 Square, ¥4", 20’ Each 21 $19.65 $412.65
168 A36 Square, 17, 20’ Each 21 $35.00 $735.00
169 A36 Square, 1 1/2" Each 11 $77.25 $849.75
170 A36 Square, 2" Each 11 $142.80 $1,570.80
171 A36 Round, ¥2", 20’ Each 36 $7.35 $264.60
172 A36 Round, 5/8", 20’ Each 21 $11.25 $236.25
173 A36 Round, ¥4", 20’ Each 21 $16.25 $341.25
174 A36 Round, 1 %", 20’ Each 26 $45.10 $1,172.60
175 A36 Round, 1 %", 20’ Each 26 $64.95 $1,688.70
176 A36 Round, 1", 20 Each 21 $28.85 $605.85
177 A36 Round, 1/4" Each 16 $2.50 $40.00
178 A36 Round, 1 3/4" Each 16 $80.55 $1,288.80
179 A36 Round, 2" Each 16 $115.35 $1,845.60
180 A36 Round, 2 1/4" Each 16 $153.15 $2,450.40
181 A36 Round, 2 1/2" Each 16 $189.05 $3,024.80
FLAT STRAP (HOT ROLLED)

182 A569 12" x 118", 20’ Each 41 $2.30 $94.30
183 A569 ¥a" x 1187, 20 Each 41 $3.45 $141.45
184 A569 ¥4" x 114", 20° Each 41 $6.90 $282.90
185 A569 1" x 1/8”, 20’ Each 201 $4.60 $924.60
186 A569 1" x 3/16", 20" Each 41 $6.90 $282.90
187 A569 1"x 1/4", 20' Each 106 $9.20 $975.20
188 A569 1-1/4" x 3/16", 20' Each 41 $8.65 $354.65
189 A569 1-1/4" x 1/4", 20' Each 31 $11.45 $354.95
190 A569 1-1/4" x 1/8", 20' Each 41 $5.75 $235.75
191 A569 1-1/2" x 3/16", 20’ Each 31 $10.35 $320.85
192 A569 11" x1/8", 20’ Each 41 $6.90 $282.90
193 A569 1Y" x Ya", 20 Each 46 $13.85 $637.10
194 A569 2" x 3/16", 20’ Each 56 $13.80 $772.80
195 A569 2" x1/8", 20’ Each 66 $9.20 $607.20
196 A569 2" X Ya", 20° Each 71 $18.40 $1,306.40
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197 A569 3" x 3/16", 20" Each 46 $20.70 $952.20
198 A569 3" x 1/4", 20' Each 26 $27.60 $717.60
199 A569 3" x 1/8", 20’ Each 26 $13.80 $358.80
200 A569 3" x 3/8", 20 Each 31 $41.40 $1,283.40
201 A569 4" x 3/16", 20' Each 41 $27.55 $1,129.55
202 A569 4" x 1/4", 20' Each 46 $36.75 $1,690.50
203 A569 4" x 1/8", 20' Each 16 $18.40 $294.40
204 A569 6" x 3/8”, 20’ Each 20 $82.65 $1,653.00
205 A569 6" x 3/16", 20" Each 28 $41.35 $1,157.80
206 A569 6" x 1/4", 20' Each 18 $55.10 $991.80
207 A569 6"x 1/8", 20 Each 28 $27.55 $771.40
208 A569 2 1/2" x 1/8", 20' Each 21 $11.50 $241.50
209 A569 2 1/2" x 3/16", 20' Each 21 $17.25 $362.25
210 A569 2 1/2" x 1/4", 20' Each 21 $23.00 $483.00
211 A569 2 1/2" x 3/8", 20 Each 21 $34.45 $723.45
212 A569 2 1/2" x 1/2", 20' Each 21 $45.90 $963.90
213 A569 31/2"x 1/8", 20' Each 21 $17.90 $375.90
214 A569 31/2" x 3/16", 20" Each 21 $25.65 $538.65
215 A569 3 1/2" x 1/4", 20 Each 21 $32.80 $688.80
216 A569 31/2" x 3/8", 20' Each 21 $48.20 $1,012.20
217 A569 31/2" x 1/2", 20 Each 21 $64.30 $1,350.30
218 A569 5" x 1/8", 20' Each 21 $28.35 $595.35
219 A569 5" x 3/16", 20" Each 21 $37.40 $785.40
220 A569 5" x 1/4", 20' Each 21 $46.80 $982.80
221 A569 5" x 3/8", 20’ Each 21 $69.15 $1,452.15
222 A569 5" x 1/2", 20' Each 21 $95.65 $2,008.65

CHANNEL (HOT ROLLED)
223 A36 13" X" X 1/8”, 20 Each 25 $16.80 $420.00
224 A36 3" x 1.498" x .258", 20’ Each 15 $56.25 $843.75
225 A36 6" x 2.034" x .314", 20’ Each 15 $131.04 $1,965.60
EXPANDED METAL

226 F1267-07 Flat Expanded Metal, 3/4" 9 gauge, 4’ X 8 Each 91 $30.00 $2,730.00
227 F1267-07 Flat Expanded Metal, ¥2", 13 gauge, 4' x 8' Each 46 $29.85 $1,373.10
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228 F1267-07 Flat Expanded Metal, %", 13 gauge, 4' x 8' Each 46 $19.20 $883.20

229 F1267-07 Raised Expanded Metal, %2", 13 gauge, 4’ x 8’ Each 41 $31.80 $1,303.80

230 F1267-07 Raised Expanded Metal, ¥.", 9 gauge, 4’ x 8’ Each 36 $30.00 $1,080.00

PIANO HINGE

231 E-152CAN4S104 |3" piano hinge with 1/4" pin (length standard stock) Each 10 $28.00 $280.00

232 Labor Rate 15 Hour 300 $32.50 $9,750.00

233 Miscellaneous Items $22,500.00
GRAND TOTAL $373,783.82

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 1. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE

LOT 2
ALUMINUM

Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total

234 B221 Aluminum Round Bar, 1/8” X 12’ Each 14 $4.00 $56.00
235 B221 Aluminum Round Bar, 1/4" X 12’ Each 19 $4.50 $85.50
236 B221 Aluminum Round Bar, 1/2" X 12’ Each 19 $6.00 $114.00
237 B221 Aluminum Round Bar, 3/4" X 12’ Each 24 $13.20 $316.80
238 B221 Aluminum Round Bar, 1" X 12’ Each 24 $23.00 $552.00
239 A429 Aluminum Square Tube 1" x 1/8" x 20' (6063-T52) Each 64 $29.00 $1,856.00
240 A429 Aluminum Square Tube 1.5" x 1/8" x 20' (6063-T52) Each 34 $40.00 $1,360.00
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241 A429 Aluminum Square Tube 2" x 1/8" x 20' (6063-T52) Each 64 $61.50 $3,936.00
242 A429 Aluminum Square Tube 2" x 3/16" x 20' (6063-T52) Each 34 $89.10 $3,029.40
243 A429 Aluminum Square Tube 2" x 1/4" x 20" (6063-T52) Each 44 $114.00 $5,016.00
244 A429 Aluminum Rectangle 1" x 2" x 1/8" x 20’ Each 34 $45.00 $1,530.00
245 A429 Aluminum Rectangle 2" x 4" x 3/16" x 20" Each 34 $138.00 $4,692.00
246 B209 .05 - 5056 GP 4' X 10" Sheet (5052) Each 34 $58.20 $1,978.80
247 B209 .090 - 5056 GP 4' X 10' Sheet (5052) Each 34 $103.65 $3,524.10
248 B209 Aluminum Sheet, 1/8” X 4'X 8 Each 34 $115.00 $3,910.00
249 B209 Aluminum Sheet, 1/4" X 4X 8’ Each 29 $245.00 $7,105.00
250 6061-T6 Aluminum Diamond Plate, 1/8" X 4'X 8’ Each 24 $263.00 $6,312.00
251 6061-T6 Aluminum Diamond Plate 3/16" X 4' X 8' Each 24 $380.00 $9,120.00
252 6061-T6 Aluminum Diamond Plate, 1/4" X 4'X 8’ Each 34 $498.00 $16,932.00
253 B308 Aluminum Channel, 3" x 1.498" x .258" x 25' Each 24 $113.00 $2,712.00
254 B308 Aluminum Channel, 6" x 1.945" x .225" x 25' Each 24 $195.00 $4,680.00
255 H22 1/8"inch Tread Brite 4' X 8' Sheet (3003) Each 27 $152.00 $4,104.00
256 H22 3/16" Tread Brite 4' x 8' Sheet (3003) Each 32 $226.00 $7,232.00
257 H14 .125 x 3/4" 4' x 8' flat expanded metal (3003) Each 24 $110.00 $2,640.00
258 A429 1" x 1" x .125 square tubing 20' (6063-T52) Each 29 $29.00 $841.00
259 A429 1" x .095 round tubing 12" Each 29 $38.00 $1,102.00

ANGEL ALUMINUM
260 B221 3/4” x 3/4” x 1/16” x 16’ (6063 -T52) Each 24 $5.00 $120.00
261 B221 1"x 1" x 1/16" x 16" (6063 -T52) Each 24 $6.50 $156.00
262 B221 1%"x1%"x1/16" x 16" (6063 -T52) Each 19 $9.00 $171.00
263 B221 3/4" x 3/4" x 1/8" x 25’ Each 19 $13.20 $250.80
264 B221 1"x 1" x 1/8" x 25’ Each 44 $17.50 $770.00
265 B221 1%"x1%"x1/18" x 25’ Each 44 $26.60 $1,170.40
FLAT STRAP ALUMINUM
266 B221 3/4" x 1/8" x 12’ Each 18 $7.80 $140.40
267 B221 1"x 1/8" x 12’ Each 18 $4.00 $72.00
268 B221 1%"x1/8" x 12 Each 43 $6.00 $258.00
269 B221 2" x 1/8" x 12’ Each 43 $8.00 $344.00
270 B221 3/4" x 1/8" x 12’ Each 23 $7.80 $179.40
271 B221 1%"x1/8" x 12 Each 33 $6.00 $198.00
272 B221 1/2" X 1/8" X 12’ Each 23 $5.50 $126.50
273 B221 3/4" X 1/4" X 12’ Each 33 $5.90 $194.70
274 B221 2" X 1/4" X 12 Each 23 $15.60 $358.80
275 B221 Aluminum Flat Strap 3/4" X 1/4" X 12' Each 28 $5.90 $165.20
276 B221 Aluminum Flat Strap 1" X 1/8" X 12' Each 18 $4.00 $72.00
277 B221 Aluminum Flat Strap 2" X 1/8" X 12' Each 18 $8.00 $144.00
278 B221 Aluminum Flat Strap 2" X 1/4" X 12' Each 18 $15.60 $280.80
ALUMINUM
BAR, SOLID

279 6061,B8221 Square, 1/8" Each 11 $5.00 $55.00
280 6061,B8221 Square, 1/4" Each 11 $5.40 $59.40
281 6061,8221 Square, 1/2" Each 11 $7.60 $83.60
282 6061,8221 Square, 3/4" Each 11 $17.00 $187.00
283 6061,8221 Square, 1" Each 11 $30.20 $332.20
284 6061,8221 Square, 1 1/2" Each 11 $67.70 $744.70
285 6061,8221 Square, 2" Each 11 $120.50 $1,325.50
286 6061,8221 Square, 2 1/4" Each 11 $152.40 $1,676.40
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Item ASTM
No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
287 6061,B221 Square, 2 1/2" Each 11 $188.00 $2,068.00
288 6061,B221 Round, 1 1/2" Each 11 $52.00 $572.00
289 6061,B221 Round, 2" Each 11 $92.00 $1,012.00
290 6061,B221 Round, 2 1/4" Each 11 $116.50 $1,281.50
291 6061,B221 Round, 2 1/2" Each 11 $143.50 $1,578.50
292 6061,B8221 Rectangle, 1/8" x 1" Each 11 $4.00 $44.00
293 6061,B8221 Rectangle, 1/4" x 1" Each 11 $7.80 $85.80
294 6061,B8221 Rectangle, 1/2" x 1" Each 11 $15.60 $171.60
295 6061,B8221 Rectangle, 3/4" x 1" Each 11 $23.30 $256.30
296 Miscellaneous Items $8,000.00
GRAND TOTAL $119,442.10

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 2. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE
RECORD AS INCOMPLETE AND NON-RESPONSIVE.

LOT 3
MAY BE FOREIGN MADE

Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total

297 n/a Female Batwing Hinge Each 135 $0.00
298 n/a Male Batwing Hinge Each 135 $0.00
299 n/a 5" Barrel Hinge with ball bearings and grease fitting Each 135 $0.00
300 n/a 7" Barrel Hinge with ball bearings and grease fitting Each 70 $0.00
301 n/a 5” Square “No Hole” Weld-on Butt Hinge Each 140 $0.00
302 n/a Long Weld-on Tab, RC-2 Each 220 $0.00
303 n/a Weld-on Tab, RC-5 Each 180 $0.00
304 n/a Weld-on Plate, RC-4, 3" x 3" Each 190 $0.00
305 n/a Weld-on Plate, RC-44, 4" x 4" Each 190 $0.00
306 n/a Weld-on Plate, RC-66, 6" x 6” Each 170 $0.00
307 Miscellaneous Items $5,500.00

GRAND TOTAL NO BID

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 3. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE
RECORD AS INCOMPLETE AND NON-RESPONSIVE.

LOT 4
STAINLESS STEEL

Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total

308 A240 18 gauge X 4'X 8' Sheet Each 24 $131.60 $3,158.40
309 A240 16 gauge X 4' X 8' Sheet Each 24 $164.50 $3,948.00
310 A240 11 gauge X 4' X 10" Perforated Sheet, 1/4” hole size, 3/8 “ stagger size Each 15 $592.00 $8,880.00
311 A240 16 gauge X 4' X 10' Perforated Sheet, 1/4 “ hole size , 3/8" stagger size Each 15 $296.50 $4,447.50
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Item ASTM
No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
312 A554 1" X .065 round tubing 20’ Each 25 $25.00 $625.00
313 A554 1" X .125 round tubing 20’ Each 20 $39.50 $790.00
314 A554 1 1/4" X .065 round tubing 20' Each 35 $32.50 $1,137.50
315 A554 1 1/2" X .065 round tubing 20' Each 35 $35.00 $1,225.00
316 A554 1" X 1" X .065 square tubing 20' Each 20 $42.00 $840.00
317 A554 1" X 1" X .120 square tubing 20' Each 20 $54.00 $1,080.00
318 A554 11/4" X 1 1/4" X .065 square tubing 20' Each 20 $50.40 $1,008.00
319 A554 11/2" X 1 1/2" .065 square tubing 20’ Each 20 $54.00 $1,080.00
320 A276 1" X 1/8" strap 12" Each 35 $12.50 $437.50
321 A276 1" X 1/4" strap 12" Each 20 $23.50 $470.00
STAINLESS STEEL 4 X 10 SHEETS
Type 304, 0.0781 inch thick, with No. 4 finish (directional satin finish on
322 A240 exposed surfaces) one side exposed Sheet 18 $257.05 $4,626.90
Type 304, 0.0500 inch thick, with No. 4 finish (directional satin finish on
323 A240 exposed surfaces) one side exposed Sheet 18 $164.50 $2,961.00
Type 304, 0.0375 inch thick, with No. 4 finish (directional satin finish on
324 A240 exposed surfaces) one side exposed Sheet 18 $123.40 $2,221.20
325 Miscellaneous Items $6,000.00
GRAND TOTAL $44,936.00

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 4. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE
RECORD AS INCOMPLETE AND NON-RESPONSIVE.

LOT 5
GALVANIZED SHEET STEEL

Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
24 gauge, G 90 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

326 A527, AB53 painting Sheet 15 $25.15 $377.25
22 gauge, G 90 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

327 A527, A653 painting Sheet 15 $30.60 $459.00
20 gauge, G 90 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

328 A527, AB53 painting Sheet 5 $35.25 $176.25
18 gauge, G 90 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

329 A527, A653 painting Sheet 5 $45.90 $229.50
24 gauge, G 60 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

330 A527, AB53 painting Sheet 5 $24.15 $120.75
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Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
22 gauge, G 60 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

331 A527, A653 painting Sheet 5 $29.60 $148.00
20 gauge, G 60 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

332 A527, AB53 painting Sheet 1 $34.25 $34.25
18 gauge, G 60 4' X 10' Galvanized Coating Designation, for field

333 A527, A653 painting Sheet 10 $44.90 $449.00

334 Miscellaneous Items $5,000.00

GRAND TOTAL $6,994.00

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 5. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE
RECORD AS INCOMPLETE AND NON-RESPONSIVE.

LOT 6
PIPE, BLACK, SCH 40

Item ASTM

No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total

335 A53 3", Sch 20 LF 400 $4.37 $1,748.00
336 A53 3", Sch 40 LF 400 $3.81 $1,524.00
337 A53 3", Sch 80 LF 400 $6.00 $2,400.00
338 A53 31/2", Sch 20 LF 400 $5.31 $2,124.00
339 A53 3 1/2", Sch 40 LF 400 $4.56 $1,824.00
340 A53 31/2", Sch 80 LF 400 $7.38 $2,952.00
341 A53 4", Sch 20 LF 400 $6.25 $2,500.00
342 A53 4", Sch 40 LF 400 $5.44 $2,176.00
343 A53 4", Sch 80 LF 400 $7.85 $3,140.00
344 A53 5", Sch 20 LF 400 $8.56 $3,424.00
345 A53 5", Sch 40 LF 400 $3.88 $1,552.00
346 A53 5", Sch 80 LF 400 $12.25 $4,900.00
347 A53 6", Sch 20 LF 400 $6.44 $2,576.00
348 A53 6", Sch 40 LF 400 $9.50 $3,800.00

P:\PU\_WORK)\_BIDs\2015\B603826\Bids Received\603826 P&S Metals abstract.xlsx

Revised IV-11




Item ASTM
No. SPECS Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Extended Total
349 A53 6", Sch 80 LF 400 $16.80 $6,720.00
350 A53 8", Sch 20 LF 400 $11.20 $4,480.00
351 A53 8", Sch 40 LF 400 $14.35 $5,740.00
352 A53 8", Sch 80 LF 400 $25.50 $10,200.00
353 A53 10", Sch 20 LF 400 $14.80 $5,920.00
354 A53 10", Sch 40 LF 400 $21.80 $8,720.00
355 A53 10", Sch 60 LF 400 $40.36 $16,144.00
356 Miscellaneous Items $6,500.00
GRAND TOTAL $101,064.00

BIDDERS MUST BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT NO. 6. TO BE CONSIDERED RESPONSIVE. ANY BID SUBMITTAL RECEIVED THAT HAS NOT BID ON ALL ITEMS IN LOT WILL BE READ INTO THE

RECORD AS INCOMPLETE AND NON-RESPONSIVE.
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