



Department of Administrative Services

Purchasing and Contracts

500 S Grand Central Pky 4th Fl • Box 551217 • Las Vegas NV 89155-1217
(702) 455-2897 • Fax (702) 386-4914

Sabra Smith Newby, Chief Administrative Officer
Adleen B. Stidhum, Purchasing Manager

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO AWARD

NOVEMBER 25, 2015

It is the intent of the Clark County Administrative Services Department, Purchasing and Contracts Division, to recommend award of Bid No.603882-15, One Time Purchase of Fire Apparatus Equipment to Burtens Fire Inc. for Lot 1, WW Williams Southwest Inc. for Lot 2, L.N. Curtis and Sons for Lots 3, 4 and 9, Fisher Scientific Company, LLC for Lots 5 and 7, Steel Edge Inc. for Lot 6, Diamondback Fire & Rescue, LLC for Lot 8.

The attached Bid Abstract provides the detail for each bid submittal received by lot. The low bidder for each lot is represented in bold.

In accordance with the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document, all Bidders have five (5) business days from receipt of this notification to submit a formal written protest to the Purchasing Analyst. The Board of County Commissioners is not required to consider any protest that is not filed in accordance with the Protest Clause in the referenced bid document.

If you have any questions concerning this notification, please contact Sandra Mendoza, Purchasing Analyst, at (702) 455-4184.

ISSUED BY:

SANDRA MENDOZA
Purchasing Analyst

Attachment(s) Bid No. 603882-15; Bid Abstract

Cc: Kelly Blackmon, Fire Department
Jeff Buchanan, Fire Department
Karl Lee, Fire Department
Riccardo Terzo, Fire Department

BID 603882-15
BID ABSTRACT

		Western States Fire Equipment		Firetrucks Unlimited		Diamondback Fire & Rescue		L.N. Curtis & Sons		W.W. Williams Southwest, Inc.		Fisher Scientific Company		Steel Edge, Inc.		CHS, Inc.		Burtons Fire, Inc.	
Line Item	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total
LOT 1																			
1	6	\$0.00	\$1,588.24	\$9,529.44	\$0.00	\$1,450.00	\$8,700.00	\$0.00	\$2,083.33	\$12,499.98	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,388.88	\$8,333.28		
2	12	\$0.00	\$811.76	\$9,741.12	\$0.00	\$670.00	\$8,040.00	\$0.00	\$958.33	\$11,499.96	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$638.88	\$7,666.56		
3	8	\$0.00	\$342.35	\$2,738.80	\$0.00	\$280.00	\$2,240.00	\$0.00	\$404.17	\$3,233.36	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$269.44	\$2,155.52		
4	12	\$0.00	\$56.47	\$677.64	\$0.00	\$47.00	\$564.00	\$0.00	\$66.67	\$800.04	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$44.44	\$533.28		
5	20	\$0.00	\$741.18	\$14,823.60	\$0.00	\$615.00	\$12,300.00	\$0.00	\$875.00	\$17,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$583.33	\$11,666.60		
6	4	\$0.00	\$56.47	\$225.88	\$0.00	\$270.00	\$1,080.00	\$0.00	\$387.50	\$1,550.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$258.33	\$1,033.32		
7	4	\$0.00	\$398.12	\$1,592.48	\$0.00	\$549.00	\$2,196.00	\$0.00	discontinued	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$772.22	\$3,088.88		
8	4	\$0.00	\$264.71	\$1,058.84	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$792.00	\$0.00	\$312.50	\$1,250.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$208.33	\$833.32		
9	4	\$0.00	\$275.29	\$1,101.16	\$0.00	\$225.00	\$900.00	\$0.00	\$325.00	\$1,300.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$216.66	\$866.64		
10	4	\$0.00	\$2,968.24	\$11,872.96	\$0.00	\$2,440.00	\$9,760.00	\$0.00	\$3,504.17	\$14,016.68	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,336.11	\$9,344.44		
11	4	\$0.00	\$175.76	\$703.04	\$0.00	\$145.00	\$580.00	\$0.00	\$207.50	\$830.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$138.33	\$553.32		
12	6	\$0.00	\$1,041.18	\$6,247.08	\$0.00	\$860.00	\$5,160.00	\$0.00	\$1,229.17	\$7,375.02	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$819.44	\$4,916.64		
LOT 1 TFT TOTAL			NO BID		\$60,312.04		NO BID		\$52,312.00		NO BID	DISQUAL	\$71,855.04		NO BID		NO BID	CORRECTED	\$50,991.80
LOT 2																			
13	4	\$41.62	\$166.48	\$42.11	\$168.44	\$34.25	\$137.00	\$35.20	\$140.80	\$35.14	\$140.56	\$37.42	\$149.68	\$44.21	\$176.84	\$0.00	\$39.30	\$157.20	
14	4	\$19.72	\$78.88	\$19.95	\$79.80	\$16.23	\$64.92	\$16.70	\$66.80	\$16.64	\$66.56	\$17.73	\$70.92	\$20.94	\$83.76	\$0.00	\$18.62	\$74.48	
15	5	\$49.95	\$249.75	\$50.60	\$253.00	\$44.30	\$221.50	\$42.45	\$212.25	\$42.18	\$210.90	\$47.17	\$235.85	\$53.06	\$265.30	\$0.00	\$47.17	\$235.85	
16	6	\$51.89	\$311.34	\$52.50	\$315.00	\$44.85	\$269.10	\$44.12	\$264.72	\$43.84	\$263.04	\$49.00	\$294.00	\$55.13	\$330.78	\$0.00	\$49.00	\$294.00	
17	6	\$39.83	\$238.98	\$40.30	\$241.80	\$34.42	\$206.52	\$33.85	\$203.10	\$33.64	\$201.84	\$37.61	\$225.66	\$42.31	\$253.86	\$0.00	\$37.61	\$225.66	
18	6	\$38.20	\$229.20	\$38.65	\$231.90	\$33.03	\$198.18	\$34.40	\$206.40	\$32.26	\$193.56	\$36.08	\$216.48	\$40.59	\$243.54	\$0.00	\$36.08	\$216.48	
19	6	\$33.84	\$203.04	\$34.24	\$205.44	\$29.24	\$175.44	\$28.75	\$172.50	\$28.56	\$171.36	\$31.96	\$191.76	\$35.95	\$215.70	\$0.00	\$31.96	\$191.76	
20	3	\$42.16	\$126.48	\$42.65	\$127.95	\$36.43	\$109.29	\$35.80	\$107.40	\$35.60	\$106.80	\$39.81	\$119.43	\$44.79	\$134.37	\$0.00	\$39.81	\$119.43	
21	4	\$48.64	\$194.56	\$49.21	\$196.84	\$42.05	\$168.20	\$48.00	\$192.00	\$41.08	\$164.32	\$46.02	\$184.08	\$51.68	\$206.72	\$0.00	\$46.02	\$184.08	
22	1	\$55.13	\$55.13	\$55.77	\$55.77	\$47.65	\$47.65	\$52.00	\$52.00	\$46.56	\$46.56	\$52.07	\$52.07	\$51.57	\$51.57	\$0.00	\$52.07	\$52.07	
23	4	\$74.59	\$298.36	\$75.48	\$301.92	\$64.48	\$257.92	\$63.40	\$253.60	\$63.02	\$252.08	\$70.44	\$281.76	\$79.25	\$317.00	\$0.00	\$70.44	\$281.76	
24	4	\$81.09	\$324.36	\$82.05	\$328.20	\$70.09	\$280.36	\$73.00	\$292.00	\$68.52	\$274.08	\$76.58	\$306.32	\$86.15	\$344.60	\$0.00	\$76.58	\$306.32	
25	1	\$87.58	\$87.58	\$88.62	\$88.62	\$56.95	\$56.95	\$84.00	\$84.00	\$73.98	\$73.98	\$82.71	\$82.71	\$93.05	\$93.05	\$0.00	\$82.71	\$82.71	
26	1	\$96.17	\$96.17	\$96.12	\$96.12	\$65.06	\$65.06	\$97.00	\$97.00	\$80.24	\$80.24	\$89.71	\$89.71	\$100.92	\$100.92	\$0.00	\$89.71	\$89.71	
27	1	\$99.16	\$99.16	\$100.33	\$100.33	\$85.71	\$85.71	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$83.76	\$83.76	\$93.64	\$93.64	\$105.35	\$105.35	\$0.00	\$93.64	\$93.64	
28	5	\$90.82	\$454.10	\$91.89	\$459.45	\$78.50	\$392.50	\$77.00	\$385.00	\$76.72	\$383.60	\$85.77	\$428.85	\$96.49	\$482.45	\$0.00	\$85.77	\$428.85	
29	4	\$97.31	\$389.24	\$98.46	\$393.84	\$84.11	\$336.44	\$84.70	\$338.80	\$82.20	\$328.80	\$91.90	\$367.60	\$103.82	\$415.28	\$0.00	\$91.19	\$364.76	
30	4	\$100.38	\$401.52	\$101.57	\$406.28	\$86.77	\$347.08	\$85.00	\$340.00	\$84.80	\$339.20	\$94.80	\$379.20	\$106.65	\$426.60	\$0.00	\$94.80	\$379.20	
31	4	\$170.57	\$682.28	\$172.60	\$690.40	\$147.44	\$589.76	\$144.00	\$576.00	\$144.12	\$576.48	\$161.09	\$644.36	\$181.22	\$724.88	\$0.00	\$161.09	\$644.36	

BID 603882-15
 BID ABSTRACT

		Western States Fire Equipment		Firetrucks Unlimited		Diamondback Fire & Rescue		L.N. Curtis & Sons		W.W. Williams Southwest, Inc.		Fisher Scientific Company		Steel Edge, Inc.		CHS, Inc.		Burton Fire, Inc.	
Line Item	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total
LOT 2 NUPLA TOTAL			\$0.00		\$4,741.10		\$4,009.58		\$4,089.37		\$3,957.72		\$4,414.08		\$4,979.57		NO BID	CORRECTED	\$4,421.96
LOT 3																			
32	4	\$0.00	\$15.37	\$61.48	\$0.00	\$12.06	\$48.24	\$14.15	\$56.60	\$9.13	\$36.52	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
33	8	\$0.00	\$217.11	\$1,736.88	\$0.00	\$194.00	\$1,552.00	\$200.00	\$1,600.00	\$218.75	\$1,750.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
34	4	\$0.00	\$19.01	\$76.04	\$0.00	\$16.00	\$64.00	\$17.50	\$70.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
35	4	\$0.00	\$176.84	\$707.36	\$0.00	\$116.00	\$464.00	\$146.65	\$586.60	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
36	4	\$0.00	\$59.21	\$236.84	\$0.00	\$22.50	\$90.00	\$38.95	\$155.80	\$67.79	\$271.16	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
37	4	\$0.00	\$131.58	\$526.32	\$0.00	\$111.00	\$444.00	\$120.20	\$480.80	\$66.89	\$267.56	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
38	4	\$0.00	\$131.58	\$526.32	\$0.00	\$111.00	\$444.00	\$120.20	\$480.80	\$117.65	\$470.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
39	4	\$0.00	\$152.63	\$610.52	\$0.00	\$102.00	\$408.00	\$155.15	\$620.60	\$122.92	\$491.68	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
40	4	\$0.00	\$210.53	\$842.12	\$0.00	\$128.00	\$512.00	\$139.40	\$557.60	\$143.75	\$575.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
41	4	\$0.00	\$159.08	\$636.32	\$0.00	\$85.00	\$340.00	\$84.45	\$337.80	\$80.76	\$323.04	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
42	4	\$0.00	\$13.11	\$52.44	\$0.00	\$5.80	\$23.20	\$9.90	\$39.60	\$16.20	\$64.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
43	48	\$0.00	\$28.22	\$1,354.56	\$0.00	\$22.50	\$1,080.00	\$25.50	\$1,224.00	\$21.67	\$1,040.16	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
44	4	\$0.00	\$103.24	\$412.96	\$0.00	\$82.40	\$329.60	\$93.60	\$374.40	\$79.26	\$317.04	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
45	48	\$0.00	\$37.96	\$1,822.08	\$0.00	\$23.00	\$1,104.00	\$41.50	\$1,992.00	\$32.21	\$1,546.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
46	4	\$0.00	\$1,521.12	\$6,084.48	\$0.00	\$1,141.00	\$4,564.00	\$1,401.25	\$5,605.00	\$2,568.99	\$10,275.96	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
47	4	\$0.00	\$78.88	\$315.52	\$0.00	\$52.00	\$208.00	\$36.35	\$145.40	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
48	4	\$0.00	\$72.30	\$289.20	\$0.00	\$20.00	\$80.00	\$66.50	\$266.00	\$19.97	\$79.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
49	2	\$0.00	\$117.11	\$234.22	\$0.00	\$98.00	\$196.00	\$120.00	\$240.00	\$156.04	\$312.08	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
50	4	\$0.00	\$235.53	\$942.12	\$0.00	\$185.00	\$740.00	\$454.35	\$1,817.40	\$468.56	\$1,874.24	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
51	12	\$0.00	\$126.30	\$1,515.60	\$0.00	\$88.00	\$1,056.00	\$75.35	\$904.20	\$61.80	\$741.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
52	12	\$0.00	\$11.18	\$134.16	\$0.00	\$5.80	\$69.60	\$10.30	\$123.60	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
53	10	\$0.00	\$19.74	\$197.40	\$0.00	\$16.50	\$165.00	\$18.50	\$185.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
54	8	\$0.00	\$17.11	\$136.88	\$0.00	\$6.12	\$48.96	\$15.75	\$126.00	\$11.30	\$90.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
55	4	\$0.00	\$51.87	\$207.48	\$0.00	\$43.80	\$175.20	\$52.10	\$208.40	\$64.80	\$259.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
56	2	\$0.00	\$375.00	\$750.00	\$0.00	\$570.00	\$1,140.00	\$537.85	\$1,075.70	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
57	5	\$0.00	\$232.36	\$1,161.80	\$0.00	\$240.00	\$1,200.00	\$227.25	\$1,136.25	\$248.88	\$1,244.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
58	20	\$0.00	\$21.71	\$434.20	\$0.00	\$145.00	\$2,900.00	\$20.00	\$400.00	\$14.89	\$297.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
59	5	\$0.00	\$23.37	\$116.85	\$0.00	\$17.00	\$85.00	\$21.50	\$107.50	\$69.26	\$346.30	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
60	5	\$0.00	\$6.18	\$30.90	\$0.00	\$5.25	\$26.25	\$5.45	\$27.25	\$9.14	\$45.70	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
61	4	\$0.00	\$23.67	\$94.68	\$0.00	\$22.00	\$88.00	\$26.05	\$104.20	\$60.90	\$243.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
62	4	\$0.00	\$22.34	\$89.36	\$0.00	\$57.00	\$228.00	\$20.55	\$82.20	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
63	4	\$0.00	\$128.95	\$515.80	\$0.00	\$104.00	\$416.00	\$113.95	\$455.80	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
64	1	\$0.00	\$27.11	\$27.11	\$0.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$24.95	\$24.95	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

BID 603882-15
 BID ABSTRACT

		Western States Fire Equipment		Firetrucks Unlimited		Diamondback Fire & Rescue		L.N. Curtis & Sons		W.W. Williams Southwest, Inc.		Fisher Scientific Company		Steel Edge, Inc.		CHS, Inc.		Burtons Fire, Inc.	
Line Item	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total
65	4		\$0.00	\$76.21	\$304.84		\$0.00	\$64.00	\$256.00	\$70.20	\$280.80	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
66	4		\$0.00	\$52.59	\$210.36		\$0.00	\$44.00	\$176.00	\$48.45	\$193.80	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
67	4		\$0.00	\$9.17	\$36.68		\$0.00	\$17.00	\$68.00	\$8.45	\$33.80	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
68	4		\$0.00	\$13.54	\$54.16		\$0.00	\$14.00	\$56.00	\$12.05	\$48.20	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
69	4		\$0.00	\$39.43	\$157.72		\$0.00	\$28.00	\$104.00	\$24.00	\$96.00	\$23.64	\$94.56		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
70	4		\$0.00	\$10.49	\$41.96		\$0.00	\$9.00	\$36.00	\$9.65	\$38.60	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
71	4		\$0.00	\$7.16	\$28.64		\$0.00	\$5.50	\$22.00	\$5.85	\$23.40	\$8.65	\$34.60		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
72	4		\$0.00	\$15.78	\$63.12		\$0.00	\$12.00	\$48.00	\$13.05	\$52.20	\$20.78	\$83.12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
73	4		\$0.00	\$65.78	\$263.12		\$0.00	\$40.00	\$160.00	\$35.90	\$143.60	\$29.44	\$117.76		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
74	4		\$0.00	\$5.21	\$20.84		\$0.00	\$4.50	\$18.00	\$4.80	\$19.20	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
75	4		\$0.00	\$51.04	\$204.16		\$0.00	\$44.00	\$176.00	\$51.55	\$206.20	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
76	4		\$0.00	\$26.28	\$105.12		\$0.00	\$40.00	\$160.00	\$24.20	\$96.80	NO BID	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
77	4		\$0.00	\$184.14	\$736.56		\$0.00	\$93.00	\$372.00	\$142.85	\$571.40	\$99.10	\$396.40		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
78	4		\$0.00	\$256.51	\$1,026.04		\$0.00	\$179.00	\$716.00	\$258.15	\$1,032.60	\$197.69	\$790.76		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
79	4		\$0.00	\$118.49	\$473.96		\$0.00	\$73.00	\$292.00	\$113.00	\$452.00	\$92.88	\$371.52		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
LOT 3 TOOLS TOTAL			NO BID		\$26,607.28		NO BID		\$22,891.05		\$24,840.05	DISQUAL	\$24,853.52		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LOT 4																			
80	16	\$30.37	\$485.92	\$54.76	\$876.16		\$0.00	\$28.00	\$448.00	\$29.28	\$468.48		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
81	20	\$24.10	\$482.00	\$53.57	\$1,071.40		\$0.00	\$22.00	\$440.00	\$23.24	\$464.80		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
82	20	\$13.50	\$270.00	\$40.48	\$809.60		\$0.00	\$13.00	\$260.00	\$13.02	\$260.40		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
83	16	\$14.64	\$234.24	\$48.81	\$780.96		\$0.00	\$13.00	\$208.00	\$14.12	\$225.92		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
84	16	\$9.40	\$150.40	\$36.90	\$590.40		\$0.00	\$8.50	\$136.00	\$9.04	\$144.64		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
85	16	\$15.24	\$243.84	\$46.43	\$742.88		\$0.00	\$14.00	\$224.00	\$141.42	\$2,262.72		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
86	8	\$20.18	\$161.44	\$69.05	\$552.40		\$0.00	\$19.00	\$152.00	\$19.46	\$155.68		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
87	8	\$19.16	\$153.28	\$53.57	\$428.56		\$0.00	\$18.00	\$144.00	\$18.46	\$147.68		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
88	4	\$19.70	\$78.80	\$63.10	\$252.40		\$0.00	\$18.00	\$72.00	\$18.92	\$75.68		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
89	6	\$212.06	\$1,272.36	\$439.29	\$2,635.74		\$0.00	\$200.00	\$1,200.00	\$209.56	\$1,257.36		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
90	4	\$234.65	\$938.60	\$482.14	\$1,928.56		\$0.00	\$221.00	\$884.00	\$231.88	\$927.52		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
LOT 4 REDHEAD TOTAL			\$4,470.88		\$10,669.06		NO BID		\$4,168.00		\$6,390.88		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LOT 5																			
91	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$2,419.44	\$9,677.76		\$0.00	\$2,504.13	\$10,016.52		\$0.00

BID 603882-15
 BID ABSTRACT

		Western States Fire Equipment		Firetrucks Unlimited		Diamondback Fire & Rescue		L.N. Curtis & Sons		W.W. Williams Southwest, Inc.		Fisher Scientific Company		Steel Edge, Inc.		CHS, Inc.		Burtens Fire, Inc.	
Line Item	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total
92	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$351.00	\$1,404.00		\$0.00	\$363.29	\$1,453.16		\$0.00
LOT 5 SCOTT TOTAL			NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		\$11,081.76		NO BID	CORRECT	\$11,469.68		NO BID
LOT 6																			
93	6		\$0.00	\$1,373.75	\$8,242.50		\$0.00	\$990.00	\$5,940.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$962.46	\$5,774.76		\$0.00		\$0.00
94	5		\$0.00	\$1,498.75	\$7,493.75		\$0.00	\$1,050.00	\$5,250.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$1,013.96	\$5,069.80		\$0.00		\$0.00
LOT 6 STIHL TOTAL			NO BID		\$15,736.25		NO BID		\$11,190.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$10,844.56		NO BID		NO BID
LOT 7																			
95	4		\$0.00	\$278.57	\$1,114.28	\$209.20	\$836.80	\$214.00	\$856.00		\$0.00	\$1.07	\$4.28		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
96	4		\$0.00	\$139.29	\$557.16	\$104.60	\$418.40	\$107.00	\$428.00		\$0.00	\$1.07	\$4.28		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
97	4		\$0.00	\$62.46	\$249.84	\$47.47	\$189.88	\$48.50	\$194.00		\$0.00	\$48.85	\$195.40		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
98	4		\$0.00	\$62.46	\$249.84	\$47.47	\$189.88	\$48.50	\$194.00		\$0.00	\$49.11	\$196.44		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
99	300		\$0.00	\$0.44	\$132.00	\$0.33	\$98.10	\$0.35	\$105.00		\$0.00	\$0.35	\$105.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
100	10		\$0.00	\$15.38	\$153.80	\$11.685	\$116.85	\$12.00	\$120.00		\$0.00	\$11.91	\$119.10		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
101	1		\$0.00	\$865.96	\$865.96	\$658.09	\$658.09	\$670.00	\$670.00		\$0.00	\$676.67	\$676.67		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
102	1		\$0.00	\$230.64	\$230.64	\$175.27	\$175.27	\$175.00	\$175.00		\$0.00	\$184.92	\$184.92		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
103	1		\$0.00	\$225.83	\$225.83	\$171.62	\$171.62	\$174.00	\$174.00		\$0.00	\$175.02	\$175.02		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
104	16		\$0.00	\$538.15	\$8,610.40	\$408.97	\$6,543.52	\$416.00	\$6,656.00		\$0.00	\$416.89	\$6,670.24		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
LOT 7 CMC TOTAL			NO BID		\$12,389.75		\$9,398.41		\$9,572.00		NO BID		\$8,331.35		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LOT 8																			
105	5		\$0.00	\$3,111.11	\$15,555.55	\$1,875.50	\$9,377.50	\$2,090.00	\$10,450.00	\$2,172.38	\$10,861.90		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$2,100.00	\$10,500.00
106	2		\$0.00	\$3,130.86	\$6,261.72	\$1,887.50	\$3,775.00	\$2,090.00	\$4,180.00	\$2,186.18	\$4,372.36		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$2,113.33	\$4,226.66
107	2		\$0.00	\$2,775.31	\$5,550.62	\$1,673.00	\$3,346.00	\$1,850.00	\$3,700.00	\$1,937.92	\$3,875.84		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$1,820.00	\$3,640.00
LOT 8 SUPER VAC TOTAL			NO BID		\$27,367.89		\$16,498.50		\$18,330.00		\$19,110.10		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	CORRECTED	\$18,366.66
LOT 9																			
108	3		\$0.00	\$1,125.00	\$3,375.00		\$0.00	\$530.00	\$1,590.00	\$562.95	\$1,688.85	\$566.31	\$1,698.93		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$774.44	\$2,323.32

BID 603882-15
 BID ABSTRACT

		Western States Fire Equipment		Firetrucks Unlimited		Diamondback Fire & Rescue		L.N. Curtis & Sons		W.W. Williams Southwest, Inc.		Fisher Scientific Company		Steel Edge, Inc.		CHS, Inc.		Burtons Fire, Inc.	
Line Item	Qty.	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total	Unit Price	Extended Total
109	3		\$0.00	\$541.67	\$1,625.01		\$0.00	\$270.00	\$810.00	\$259.50	\$778.50	\$264.06	\$792.18		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$361.11	\$1,083.33
110	3		\$0.00	\$391.67	\$1,175.01		\$0.00	\$190.00	\$570.00	\$188.75	\$566.25	\$190.94	\$572.82		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$261.11	\$783.33
LOT 9 DUO SAFETY LADDERS TOTAL			NO BID		\$6,175.02		NO BID		\$2,970.00		\$3,033.60		\$3,083.93		NO BID		NO BID	DISQUAL	\$7,016.13